
Kennedy Funeral 
Timetable Today 

WASHINGTON (UPI) — The 
timetable for the Kennedy fu-
neral today (all times central 
standard): 

8 to 9 a.m.—Final public view-
ing of the casket as it lies in 
state in the Capitol Rotunda. 

9:45 a.m. — Mrs. Jacqueline 
Kennedy departs White House 
for Capitol. 

10 a.m.—Funeral p r o cession 
departs Capitol for White House, 
where Mrs. Kennedy and select 
group of dignitaries leave lim-
ousines and walk behind casket-
bearing caisson to St. Matthews 
Cathedral, more than half-mile 
away. 

11 a.m. — Pontifical requiem 
Mass celebrated by Richard 
Cardinal Cushing, archbishop of 
Boston. The cortege then pro-
ceeds to Arlington National 
cemetery for burial. 

2 to 2:30 p.m. (approximate)—
Mrs. Kennedy at White House 
receives visiting heads of state 
and heads of foreign delegations 
to funeral. 

4:30 p.m.—President Johnson 
receives chiefs of state and 
chiefs of foreign delegations at 
diplomatic reception room in 
State Department. 


