
C 

NYTimes 	 26 Dr • 1966 

Reins Weighed 

By E. W. KENWORTHY 
Special to The New York Times 

WASHINGTON, April 25-
A small group of Senators re-
sponsible for monitoring the 
Central Intelligence Agency met 
today to discuss whether their 
"watchdog" committee should 
be enlarged and its surveillance 
,tightenea. 

The bipartisan group is made 
up of ranking members of the 
Armed Services Comniittee and 
the Appropriations subcommit-
tee dealing with funds for the 
armed services. 

For many years the Senate 
group and a comparable group 
in the House, also drawn from 
the Armed Services and Ap-
propriations Committees, have 
constituted the only "legislative 
oversight" of the secret opera-
tions and the secret funds of the 
C.I.A. 

For many years also a large 
number of Senators -and Repre-
sentatives have urgedthat these 
two groups be expanded to in-
elude ',members of the Senate 
Foreign Relations and House 
Foreign Affairs Committees 
so that the activities of the 
agency would be subjected more 
closely, to political considera-
tions.,' 

Although Senator Richard B. 
Russell, chairrilan of the Armed 
SerVices Committee , and the 
watchdog 	committee, 	has 
resisted these suggestions, in- 
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formed sources said he called 
today's meeting precisely to 
consider such an expansion. 

These sources said also that 
two recent disclosures of C.I.A. 
activities had apparently 
brought the whble issue to a 
head in the Senate watchdog 
group. 

The first of these was the 
revelation that at least five 
C.I.A. agents operated in South 
Vietnam during the late 1950's 
under the cover of a multi-mil-
lion dollar technical assistance 
program conducted for the govL,  
ernment of the late President 
Ngo Dinh Diem by Michigan 
State University. 

Intercedes in Suit 
The second was the disclosure 

that the CIA. interceded in the 
slander trial of one of its agents, 
Jini Raus, an Estonian refugee, 
who was being sued by Eerik 
Heine, another Estonian emi-
gre. Mr. Heine charged that Mr. 
Raus had publicly called him 
an agent of the' K.G.B., the 
Soviet intelligence agency. 

In a public memorandum ad-
dressed to the Federal Court in 
Baltimore, the C.I.A. said it 
had ordered Mr. Raus to cease '  
testifying in order to protect 
the United States foreign intel-
ligence apparatus. Mr. Raus 
claimed immunity on the ground 
that the alleged slander had 
been committed in the course 
of his C.I.A. duties. 

Several days ago Senator J. W. 
Fulbright, chairman of the For-
eign Relations Committee, wrote 
to Senator Russell suggesting 
that they discuss the possibility 
of having representatives from 
his committee on the watchdog 
group. It could not be learned 
whether Mr. Russell has replied 
to this letter. 

Senator Eugene J. McCarthy, 
Democrat of Minnesota, and a 
member of the Foreign Rela-
tions Committee, has expressed 
concern that the C.I.A. "is mak-
ing foreign policy and in so 
doing is assuming the roles of 
President and Congress." 
1 Mr. McCarthy has introduced 
a resolution calling for a "full 
and complete" study of the ef-
fect of C.I.A. operations on 
policymaking by a special sub-
committee of the Foreign Rela-
tions Committee. He also favors 
expanding the present oversight 
group to include members of the 
Foreign Relations Committee. 

Responsibility Cited 
Today Mr. McCarthy said that, 

in view of the Michigan State 
and Rails cases, Congress would 
be rejecting "s, very basic con-
stitutional responsibility" if it 
did not begin "to exercise some 
degree of jurisdiction beyond 
what it is exercising now." 

"Either the special group 
doesn't know about these 
things and it should, or it does 
know and tolerates them," Mr. 
McCarthy said. 

Senator Mike Mansfield of 
Montana, the Majority Leader, 
said with a smile that the pro- 

posal to widen the watchdog 
committee was "not a bad 
idea." 

In 1954 Mr. Mansfield intro-
duced a resolution 'to create a 
12-man joint committee 	six 
from each house—to maintain 
scrutiny on the C.I.A. 

The resolution had 34 co-
sponsors. However, much of the 
support evaporated under the 
opposition of Senator Russell 
and Senator Leverett Salton-
stall, Republican of Massachu-
setts, who agreed with the then 
C.I.A. director, Allen W. Dulles, 
that the joint committee might 
jeopardize security. 

When the Mansfield resolu-
tion finally came to a vote in 
1956, 14 sponsors reversed 
themselves, and it was defeat-
ed, 59 to 27. 

Besides Mr. Russell and Mr. 
Saltonstall, the present watch-
dog committee is made up of 
Democrats John Stennis of Mis-
sissippi, Carl Hayden of Ari-
zona, Stuart Symington of Mis-
souri, and Republicans Milton R. 
Young of North Dakota and 
Margaret Chase Smith of Maine. 


