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Oswald's Guns Valued at $10,000 

Dallas 
L e e Harvey Oswald's 

widow yesterday received 
legal rights to his proper-
ty, including the rifle he 
used to assassinate Presi- 
dent Kennedy. 

The 6.5 m.m Italian mili-
tary rifle and a 38-cal. pistol 
Oswald used to slay police-1 
man J. D. Tippet were val-
ued at $10,000 because of 
their historical interest. 

Probate Judge F. W. Brat-
lett Jr. appointed Marina 
Oswald to handle the estate. i 

Other items left by Oswald 
included a diary. a four-pow- 

er telescopic sight, a two-
piece sling and a cartridge 
clip. 

M r s. Oswald's attorney, 
William Blaylock, said his 
client was anxious to sell the 
items to provide for her se-
curity. 

Blaylock said Mrs. Oswald 
had received a $10,000 bid for 
the pistol and rifle from a 
gun collector. 	United Press 


