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Questions on Health of Nixon 
Involve Treatment and Courts 

'By LAWRENCE K. ALTMAN 
How sick is former President less dangerous superficial or 

Richard M. Nixon? the more dangerous deep ven-
ous thrombophlebitis, Dr. Lun-
gren said he would have "no 
comment" until "I have ob-
served him a little longer." 

Dr. Lungren declined to con-
firm Mrs. Eisenhower's report 
that her father would enter a'  

hospital. He cited the confiden-
tiality of the patient-doctor 
relationship. 

Dr. Lungren also said that he 
clearly understood the public 
confusion that had been raised 
by the lack of specific medical 
facts and details amid state-
ments made by Nixon family 
members and the series of dra-
matic statements that Dr. 
Tkach made over the weekend. 

New Blood Clot Cited 
Dr. Tkach, after conferring 

with Dr. Lungren, issued a terse 
statement in San Clemente, Ca-
lif., saying that Mr. Nixon had 
developed a new blood clot and 
a flare-up of the chronic phlebi-
tis in his left thigh. 

Dr. Tkach's office at Andrews 
Air Force Base, where he has 
assed a new job as command 
surgeon for the Air Force Base, 
where he has assumed a new 
job as command surgeon for 
the Air Force Systems Com-
mand, said the Air Force gener-
al was "unavailable" and did 
not want to discuss Mr. Nixon's 
case further with the press. 

"Any actions that Dr. Tkach 
has had, or will have, in con-
nection with the health of for-
mer President Nixon will be re-
ported as required from San 
Clemente," a spokesman for Dr. 
Tkach said. 

Dr. Tkach said in a statement 
that because his new duties re-
quired constant briefing, he 
would not have further state-
ments until the briefing was 
completed. An Air Force 
spokesman estimated the brief-
ings would last "several 
weeks." The spokesman added: 
"He's been away from the Air 
Farce for several years." 
MI Dr. Tkach's statement 
raised speculation in medical 
circles that he may not be re-
turning, to see Mr. Nixon at San 
Clemente, as he had said he 
was scheduled to do later this 
week. 

Meanwhile, Howard K. Smith, 
the television commentator, re-
ported, "It has now been 
learned by C News that Dr. 
Tkach did not personally exa-
mine Mr. Nixon's leg but took 
the word of a California physi-
cian, Dr. John C. Lungren, that 
the phlebitis had spread to the 
tigh." 

Dr. Tkach, an Air Force 
spokesman said, would not 
comment on the report. 

Dr. Lungren also said he had 
"no comment" on the ABC re-
port. 

That question is baffling ev-
eryone, apparently including 
some officials in the White 
House. 

The answers to the:seemingly 
limitless number of questions 
that have bee aised in recent 
days about Mr. Nixon's mental 
and physical health are not 
clear. 

However, the facts involved 
are of critical importance not 
just to the Nixon family but 
also to , the nation's political 
and judicial systems. 

Yesterday, Julie Nixon Eisen-
hower added to the confusion 
about the state of Mr. Nixon's 
health by disclosing that her 
father 'would be "hospitalized 
in a week or so because of the 
phlebitis." 

Though Mr. Nixon apparently 
agreed to the recommendation, 
made by one of his doctors, Air 
Force Maj. Gen. Walter Tkach, 
last week, the timing of his hos-
pitalization puzzled doctors fa-
miliar with the treatment of 
phlebitis. 

Patients with a flare-up of 
chronic phlebitis, such as Mr. 
Nixon, are generally hos-
pitalized so that treatment with 
blood-thinning, o anticoagulant, 
drugs can be started and diag-
nostic tests done immediately, 
not in a few weeks. Dr. Tkach 
has said he consideed anti-
coagulant therapy "critical" in 
Mr. Nixon's case. 

Some Open Questions 
Mr. Nixon's apparent rejec-

tion of is doctors' medical rec-
ommendations—to take anti-
coagulants, to wear elastic leg 
stockings and to keep his left 
leg constantly outstretched and 
elevated—raise other unanswer-
ed questions, such as the follow 
ing: 

Err° what extent has Mr. 
Nixon aggravated his condition 
by uch refusals? 

4lIf he had followed the pre-
scribed therapy, would the 
phlebitis have cleared up by 
now? 

91Why announce his proposed 
hospitaization a week in ad-
vance? Is t a tactic to avoid 
appearing in court in the Water-
gate cover-up trial and others? 

There is no way to get de-
tailed answers to the questions 
that only Mr. Nixon and his 
physicians Dr. Tkach and Dr. 
John C. Lungren of Long Beach, 
Calif., can answer. 

Yesterday, Dr. Lungren said 
in a telephone interview from 
his office in Long Beach, where 
he has a private practice in in-
ternal medicine: 

"I examined him yesterday. I 
am treating him on a continu-
ing basis." 

Asked if Mr. Nixon had the 


