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ExmiHumphrey Aide Pleads Guilty 
gt. Paul, Minn. 

Senator Hubert H. Hum-
Phrey's former press secre-
07 pleaded guilty yester- 
day to aiding and abetting . 
legal corporate donations to 
Political campaigns by milk 
producers. 

Norman Sherman and his 
business partner, Jack Val-
entine, who also pleaded 
guilty, each posted a $1000 
personal recognizance bond 
in U.S. District Court in St. 
Raul. Sherman faces a max-
itnum sentence of one year 
in jail and a $1000 fine. 

Sherman and Valentine  

were named in a criminal 
information by the Water-
gate prosecutor's office. It 
said the two aided and abet-
ted the use of money from 
the Associated Milk Produc-
ers, Inc., to purchase com-
puter-mail lists used i 
Humphrey's 1972 presiden-
tial campaign and in a num-
ber of other Democratic 
campaigns., including that of 
South Dakota Senator James 
Abourezk. 

Both Humphrey a n d 
Abourezk have said they 
were unaware of the nature 
of the contributions. 

Sherman was Humphrey's 
press secretary when the 
Minnesota Democrat w a s 
vice president. Sherman and 
Valentine later formed a 
computer mail firm with of-
fices in Minneapolis and 
Washington. 

Valentine and Sherman  

was given to the two from 
July 1.9 to Dec. 21, 1971, for 
voter lists in Minnesota, 
South Dakota, Iowa and oth-
er Midwest states. 

The lists were only used in 
political races, and did not 
give any business benefit to 
the co-op. 
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