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tinez ana,rsernaro L. barker 
ere given lighter sen-

tences for what .Gesell „said 
was, their lesser roles in''the 
crime. 

Liddy, who is serving , 
prison terms in the original.;; 
break-in ease, and on Sill  

Ate s 
SENTENCE, From Al 

tempt charges under which 
he is not eligible for parole 
until April, 1981, was sen- 
tenced to one .to three years. 
That term will run concur-
rent with his current sen- 
tences, so the sentence does 
not have the effect of auto-
matically lengthening the 
original term. 

Barker and Martinez, two 
of the men who actually car- 
ried out the break-in, were 
placed on probation. Judge 
Gesell said the two men, 
who served a year in prison 
for the Watergate break-in, 
has been "duped by govern- 
ment officials" and had 
been "adequately punished." 

Ehrlichman and the three 
Other defendants were con- 
victed after a 12-day trial on 
charges that they conspired 
to violate the civil rights of 
Dr. Lewis Fielding, who was 
the psychiatrist of Pentagon 
Papers codefendat Daniel 
Ellsberg, by breaking into .  
Fielding's Beverly Hills, 
Calif., office on Sept. 3, 1971. 

Ehrlichman was also con-
victed by the jury of three 
counts of lying to federal in- r 
vestigators probing the 
break-in. After the trial, 
Judge Gesell dismissed the 
charge that Ehrlichman had ! 
lied to the FBI, but allowed 
standing the two counts that 
charged Ehrlichman-  with ly-; 
in to Watergate grand .ju-
ries. 

Judge Gesell said he had 
"put out of  this court's 
mind" any accusations 
against Ehrlichman in other 
Watergate-related activities 
in deciding on the prison 
sentence. 

"After giving heavy 
weight to the many affirma- 
tive aspects of your life, 
without which the court 
would impose a far more se- 
vere sentence, you are sen-
tenced to 20 months to five 
years on each count, the 
counts to run concurrently," 
Gesell said. 

Ehrlichman stood erect as 
Judge Gesell imposed the 
sentence, showing little if 
any emotion as he returned 
to his seat at the defense ta-
ble and poured himself a 
glass of water. 

His attorney, William S. 
Prates, had' chosen not to 
make any remarks at the 
time of sentencing.° 

In remarks to newsmen  

later, Ehrlichroan went" into 
some detail about his view 
of the case. 

"I have a clear con-
science," Ehrlichman said. 
"I am confident ... that I 
will ultimately be exoner-
ated and vindicated." 

He said that the episode 
merely represented the reg- 
ular government operation 
of "people who are con-
stantly required to balance 
against the interest of the 
nation as a whole." 

He gave as eXamples a 
farmer whose farm must be 
given up so it can be used as 
an air base, or a draftee who 
must give up two years of 
his life for the government. 
"There was balancing of 
that kind in this case," Ehrl- 
ichman calmly told news- 
men outside the courthouse. 

He said that his view ipf 
the case—that national seen-
rity justified the activities 
that led to the break-in and 
the break-in itself—was not 
allowed by the judge and 
that he and his lawyers 
viewed that "as an error of 
law." 

He again asserted that he 
had no knowledge that any 
illegal or improper action 
was going to be undertaken 
by, the White House special 
investigation u n i t, which 
came to be known as °the 
plumbers, and whose mem-
bers were charged in this 
case. 

He also reiterated his de-
fense to the perjury counts, 
saying he had answered 
questions about the plum-
bers unit to the best of. his 
recollection at the, time' he 
had been confronted in the 
grand jury "by a battery of 
lawyers shooting questibns" 
at him. 

Ehrlichman still, faces 
'charges in ',Lop - Angeles 
County' of perjury before a 
grand jury there,which was 
also investigating the break-, 

in. District Attorney -Joseph 
Busch said'yesterday there 
was a possibility that those 
charges would be' dropped 
in view of Ehlichman'scon-
viction,,,and sentence on. the 
federal Case. 

The sentencing of B'arker 
and Martinez apparently 
brings to and' end their part 
in Watergate-related cases, a 
role that surfaced when 
they wer found to be among 
five men caught in the Dem-
ocratic. headquarters at the 
Watergate, office complex on 
June 17, 1972. Their alleged 
role in the Ellsberg break-in 
was discovered as the inves-
tigation progressed into the 
cover-up of the original 
Watergate burglary. 

They pleaded guilty in the 
Watergate break-in, but are 
attempting, on appeal, to 
change their pleas to inno-
cent so they can stand trial. 

Of the two men,otnly 
tinez made a statement at: 
yesterday's sentencing bet:.  
fore. Judge Gesell. With a '  

heavy Spanish accent, he 
said that "it was never in 
ny mind to do any wrongdo-
ing . .. my motivation was 
not to become a criminal." 

Judge Gesell told the two 
men, who are strong sup-
porters of freedom for 
Cuba, that they contributed 
to illegal activity "which in, 
many ways was typical of 
the very regime you each so 
strenucusly and coura-
geoulsy opposed in Cuba. 

"as you both well know, it 
is impossible to preserve 
freedom anywhere when 
zealots take over and the 
rule of law is ignored." 
law is ignored." 

Liddy, who has steadfastly 
maintained his silence on 
any Watergate matters, said 
he had "nothing at all" to 
say upon his sentencing. His 
attorney, Peter Maroulis, 
merely outlined Liddy's cur-
rent prison terms. 

Judge Gesell said that 
Liddy had a middle level de-
gree of responsibility in this 
case," but added that "the 
evidence demonstrates 'Tour 
violation was deliberate -and 
your offense is clear." 

Liddy is currently serving 
a contempt of court term in 
D.C. jail for refusing to tes-
tify to a Watergate .grand 
jury, and Judge Gesell said 
he would recommend that 
Liddy be transferred from 
that facility as soon as possi-
ble under the current sen-
tence. 

"The court is - ver on-
celled that you are in the 
D.C. jail, which I don't think 
is a fit place for you or 'any-
one else to be," Judge Ge-

%sell said. 
There was little visible 

drama in the courtroom. yes-
terday. 

Ehrlichman chatted with 
his '4.1t1tineys until Judge 
Gesell eerie into the .court-
room at 9:33 a.m. The court- 



grant immunity for testi-
fying against Ehrlichman. 

The unit's first main con- 
cern was Ellsberg and the 
leak of the Pentagon Pa- ' 
pers, and it began focusing 
its investigation on that. 

As the investigation pro-
gressed, it had a dual pur-
pose, according to trial testi-
mony. One was to deter-
mine Ellsberg's motives for 
releasing the papers; the 
other was to discredit Ells-
berg as an antiwar spokes-
man. Former White House 
special counsel Charles W. 
Colson has pleaded guilty 
and is serving a one to three 
year prison sentence for ob-
structing justice in the case 
by disseminating derogatory 
information about Ellsberg. 

The plumbers decided 
they needed additional in-
formation for a CIA psycho-
logical profile on Ellsberg, 
an idea that spawned the 
break-in at Fielding's office. 
Fielding had refused;,-to co-
operate with the Fill, rely-
ing on the docto4atient 
privilege to keep suei infor-
mation confidential.,  

Ehrlichman's role in ap- .  
proving the break-in came 
in at least two conversa-
tions with Young and 
Krogh, ,acccording, to the 
trial witnesses, and his init-
ialed approval of a "covert 
operation" to examine the 
files. 

The charges on which 
Ehrlichman was sentenced 
yesterday carried a maxi-
mum possible penatly .of 20 
years in jail and fins total-
ing $30,000. Liddy, "Barker 
and Martinez could, have 
been sentenced to a maxi-
mum of 10 years in jail and 
$10,000 in fines. 

Sentences of Nixon ad-
ministration officials by fed-
eral judges in Watergate 
and related matters have 
ranged from the one-month-
suspended sentence of for-
mer Attorney General Rich-
ard G. Kleindienst by U.S. 
District Judge George L. 
Hart Jr. to the maximum 20 
years given' Liddy in,  the 
original break-in case by 
U.S. District Judge John J. 
Sirica. 

In between have been Col-
son's one-year sentence; a 
10-to-30-month sentence im-
posed on former presiden-
tial appointments secretary 
Dwight L. Chapin; the six-
month sentence on Krogh—
all imposed by Judge Gesell. 
In addition, there had been 
a 30-day sentence imposed 
on former White House aide 
Herbert L. (Bart) Porter by 
U.S. District Judge William 
B. Bryait and a Iti-to-48- 
month sentence on former 
White House aide Jeb 
Stuart Magruder by Judge 
Sirica. 
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Judge Gerhard A. GeSell at U.S. District Court. 

 

room was packed and 
hushed. 

Only a handful of would-
be spectators was unable to 
get intto watch the proceed-
ings. lidember of Ehrlich-
man'sri family had attended 
she trial regularly but were 
not present yesterday. Lid-
dy's wife watched from a 
front row, as did Barker's 
daughter. Except for the full 
spectator section it could 
have been any criminal pro-
ceeding in the federal court-
house here. 

The conspiracy count on 
which Ehrlichman was con-
victed grew out of a chain of 
events that began in' the 
summer of 1971, when Pre-
sient Nixon organized a spe-
cial secret Unit in the White 
House to track down and 
stop leaks of classified infor-
mation. The formation of 
that unit came against a 
background of! Ellsberg's 
having distributed to the 
press the highly classified 
Pentagon Papers to the 
press for publication. 

Ehrlichman was Nixon's 
first choice to head the unit, 
but the President later 
asked Ehrlichman to assign 
someone else to the task. As 
the unit grew, it was headed 
by Egil (Bud) Krogh, who 
pleaded guilty in the Ells-
berg case to civil rights con-
spiracy and served a six-
month prison term, and 
David R. Young, who was 

 

 

 


