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Study Jury 
Citing of Nixon 

By George Lardner Jr. 
Washington Post Staff Writer 

The Supreme Court agreed yesterday to consider 
whether the Watergate grand jury overstepped itself in 
naming President Nixon as an unindicted co-conspirator • 
in the Watergate cover-up. . 

The justices officially disclosed at the same time the 
grand jury's accusation that "Richard M. Nixon . . . was 

1974 

a member of the conspiracy to 
defraud the United States and 
to obstruct justice" kinthe 
scandal.  

The court refused, however, 
to make public any other por-
tions of the sealed legal briefs 
and hearings on the issue last 
month before U.S. District 
Court Judge John J. Sirica. 

The only excerpt made pub-
lic stated that: 

"On February 25, 1974, in 
the course of its consideration 
in the instant case, the June 
5, 1972, grand jury, by vote 
of 19-0, determined that there 
is probable cause to believe 
that Richard M. Nixon (among 
others) was a member of the 
conspiracy to defraud the 
United States and to obstruct 
justice Charged in Count 1 of 
the instant indictment, and 
the,grand jury authorized the 
special prosecutor to identify 
Richard M. Nixon (among 
others) as an unindicted co-
conspirator in connection with 
subsequent legal proceedings 
in this case." 

Mr. Nixon asked the Su-
preme Court last week; to re-
view the constitutionality of 
the grand jury's action. The 
court had already agreed . to 
consider Special Prosecutor 
Leon Jaworski's efforts to sub-
poena new evidence from the 
President despite Mr. Nixon's 
claims of executive privilege. 

In approving the President's 
request, the justices said they 
would hear arguments on the 
grand jury's authority at the 

!same July 8 hearing that .they 
had already scheduled to take 
up Jaworski's subpoena. 

The prosecutor is demand-
ing the tapes and other rec- 
ords of 64 White House con- 
versations which he says are 
nedapd for the September 
coVM-up trial of sixof Mr. 
Nixon's former top aides rand 
campaign advisers. 

Justice William H. Rehn- 

quist took no part-in yester-
day's fulirtgAlrecourt's order 
did not say how many justices 
voted to add Mr. Nixon's chal-
lenge of 'the grand jury's au-
thority to the issues before 
them, but at least four votes 
were required under court 
rules. 

Jaworski disclosed the 
grand jury's explosive allega-
tion' against Mr. Nixon last 
month at secret hearings be-
fore Judge Sirica on the need 
for the 64 subpoenaed tapes. 
The judge decided to enforce 
the subpoena and ordered Mr. 
Nixon on May 20 to surrender 
the recordings for Sirica's pri-
vate inspection. 

The Surpeme Court agreed 
on May 31 to take up the con-
troversy under special rules 
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reserved , fore, cases 	of 
"imperative public impor-
tance": 

News of_ the grand jury's 
naming of the President as art 
unindicted 	co-nonspirator ,  
leaked out a few days later. 
Both the White House and 
Watergate prosecutors then 
asked that the entire record of 
the hearings before Judge Sir-
Ica be released on the grounds 
that they. contained no other 
big se cr ets , but lawyers for 
the cover-up case') defendants 
objected. 

The Supreme Court appar 
ently decided to, keep the doc-
uments under seal simply to 
avoid a new round of defense 
protests 'over prejudicial pre-
trail publicity. 

The justices said the first 
round of legal briefs would 
still be due, on JUffe i21 and 
any replies by Jgly 1: Oral ar-
guments have been set, for 
July 8 at lcia.m. 

Mr. Nixon has contended 
that the grand jury's action  

amounts to an improper inter-
ference, with the impeachment 
powers`vested in the House of 
Representatives. The Presi-
dent's chief defense lawyer, 
James D. St. Clair, has also 
protested that the grand jiury's 
allegation, if it is allowed to 
stand, "could be interpreted to 
mean that a President would 
be, subject to similar action by 
any grand jury throughout the 
United States." 

Jaworski has defended the 
charge as both "necessary and 
appropriate" to criminal pros-
ecution of the cover-up case in 
the courts. The special prose-
cutor has suggested that, as a 
matter of law, the President 
might even be subject to in-
dictment, although Jaworski is.  
known Ito have F  cOunseled the 
grand jury against such a step. 

The question of whether im-
peachment must come first 
has never been settled. The 
Constitution 	says 	only, 
"Judgment in eases of im-
peach.ment shall not extend 
further than to removal from 
office and disqualification to 
hold and enjoy any office of 
honor, trust or profit under 
the United States; but the 
party convicted shall never-
theless be liable and subject, 
to indietnient, trial, judgment 
and punishment, according to 
laW." 

The White House hai taken 
the position that this mea 
Mr., Nixon cannot even be 
named an unindictO, co-con-
spirator, much les,e,..'indicted, 
so long as he remains Presi-
dent. But some legal scholars 
contend that the inipeachment 
provisions of the Constitution 
\---ere simply meant to prevent 
federal officials •from pleading 
double jeopardy in case they 

should be impeached, first and - 
indicted later. 

TheChighest court ruling on 
the issue was a deciSion ear-
lier this year by the"Seventh 
U.S.circuit Court of Appeals 
in, Ohicago upholding the 1973 
bribery, conviction of Circuit 
Judge Otto Kerner. The court 
said itkiaw no reason to eX-
empt any federal ; officials 
from indictment. 

. . Whatever immunities 
or privileges the Constitution 
confers for the purpose of as-
suring the independence of 
the44-equal branches of gov-
ernment, they do not' eiempt 

	

the ...members , of 	those 
brancheS 'from the opercion 

	

`of the,,oVinary crimi 	laws," 
the la e a l s conk 
"Crantatil conduct is not Raft 
of thernecessary fUntion per-
formedby public officials." 

Lawyers for both Kerner 
and the government, expect 
the Supreme Court to decide, 
before adjourning this sum-
mer, whether to hear the 

nerease in the fall. 
In yesterday's 'Order involv-

ing Mr. Nixon, the justices 
said they also wanted to tear 
arguments on whether Judge 
Sirica's May 20 ruling direct-
ing tienforcement of the., sub-
poena against the President 
wa `an appealable order." 

rmally, an individual who 
contests a subpoena must first 
be held in contempt and it is 
only-the lower 'court's finding 
of contempt that can 'be ap-
pealed. 

In Mr. Nixon's, case, how-
eVer, both White ( House law-
yeruand Watergate prosecu-
tors'ave taken the position 
thaf would be unseemly to 
`require that the Pres*nt be 
held in contempt in order to 
get the controversy; reviewed' 
by higher courts. 

The Ihigh court concluded 
yesterday's ruling by direct-
ing thAt any portions of , legal 
briefsMealing with issues tin-
der seal be similarly submit- 

ted !,tinder seal. Watergate 
prosecutors and White House 
laWyers were also directed to 
refrain at the July 8 hearing 
"from disclosing any portions 
of the ,record that are under 
seal," 

 sealed records include 
lawoiski's justifications for 
each of the 64 tapes he is seek-
ing, even Ithough all of these 
justifications are based on 
public testimony. 

The secret grand jury evi-
dence against Mr. Nixon him-
self, however, has not been 
transmitted to the Supreme 
Court,* 

TherPresident has asked Sir. ' 
ica to,:send the evidence to the 
-high eourt, but Jawonski. is op-
posing that effort. TO prose-
cutor contends that the.Thite 
House has no basis * wking 
what amounts to a trfellin the 
Supreme Court on the merits 
of the grand jury's •decision 
and is entitled only to attack 
its legality. 


