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CAIRO — Cairo's plushest 
hotel — the Nile Hilton -
was commandeered yester-
day for 500 American offi-
cials and journalists flying 
in for President Nixon's 
three-day Egyptian visit 
that begins tomorrow. 

A spokesman for the Hil-
ton said the hotel will be 
closed to the public until 
Friday afternoon when Pres-
ident Nixon flies from here 
to Saudi Arabia. 

The spokesman said that 
all of the evicted guests -
including British tourists -
had been found rooms in 
nine other smaller Cairo ho-
tels. 

U.S. embassy and Egyp-
tian officials said here that 
600 American officials and 
500 American and other 
journalists had begun flying 
into Cairo in the biggest 
ever influx of Americans 
into Egypt. 

For  the second day, 
hundreds of American and 
Egyptian security men con-
tinued searching rooftops for 
possible sniper's nests. 

Special precautions were 
being taken against . possi-
ble attack from extremist 
Palestine guerrilla groups. 


