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A Lot of Talk-- 
But No Action 
	 Joseph Kraft 

 

THIS CITY is alive with talk of platy 
-I- and plots to push the President out 

and the vice president in. But on examina-
tion, all the scenarios for the painless dep-
osition of Mr. Nixon dissolve into mere 
rumor and speculation. There is, in other 
words, a good deal less going on than 
meets the ear. 

Everybody's favorite scenario provides 
that a group of senior Republicans go to 
421' White House and tell the President 
that, for the good of the party, and the 
office and the country, he has to step 
down. Senator Barry Goldwater and for-
mer,Defense Secretary Melvin Laird are 
usually cast as the top bananas in that 
enterprise. 

Senator Goldwater, to be sure, was 
conspiciously - forthright in condemning 
the early phases of the Watergate cover-
up, Privately he has indicated to several 
colleagues his belief that President Nixon 
is deeply involved. But the senator's most 
recent statements — to the effect that Mr. 
Nixon might resign if impeachment was 
voted by the House and that Mr. Nixon 
would himself know when the time was 
ripe for resignation — bear the marks of a 
man backing away from responsibility. 
While Senator Goldwater seems to enjoy 
being perceived as the man who holds the 
dagger, he doesn't have the stomach to 
drive the blade home. 

* * * 

kIRD IS probably the leading politi-
-1-4 cal strategist in Washington, and he 
has.  the widest range of connections in the 

Republican party. But 'he and his friends 
have been doing fine just by occupying the 
territory which Mr. Nixon keeps abandon-
ing. 

In that way Gerald Ford, a principal 
Laird intimate, became vice president. An-
other Laird intimate, John Rhodes of Ari-
zona, took Ford's place as house minority 
leader. A third friend, former Congress-
man Robert Ellsworth., is moving into a 
key position in the Pentagon: Laird and 
his friends have, of course, taken their 
distances from Mr. Nixon. 

Congressman Rhodes has said that the 
President might consider resigning, and 
that the Republican party would fare bet-
ter this November if • Ford were at the 
helm. Laird himself, even during a stint in 
the White House, let everybody know that 
he was critical of the way the President 
had handled Watergate. 

Apart from that opportunistic posture, 
however, Laird and his friends are not 
moving. Nor is the rest of the Republican 
party. 

* * * 
A SECOND SET of rumors has the 

President making a deal to avoid 
prosecution, and then resigning. But it is 
virtually unthinkable that federal author-
ites, whether Democratic or Republican, 
would prosecute the President once he 
had resigned. 

It seems doubtful that state prosecu-
tions, or civil suits against Mr. Nixon, 
would be upheld. Even if Mr. Nixon need-
ed such protection, it would be very hard, 
constitutionally, to give him immunity. 


