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MAY lot 1874 Ford calls Nixon innocent .  

Associated Press 

HOUSTON — Vice Presi-
dent Ford revealed yester 
day that his talk Friday with 
President Nixon was ar-
ranged after news reports of 
his speech attacking the ad-
ministration. He then re-
peated his beliefs that Nixon 
is innocent of wrongdoing in 
Watergate and will noVe44 
sign. 	 < 

Speaking at a Republican 
rally, Ford said, "I am con- 

\Tinged that PresidentiNixon 
knew nothing of the ;plan to 
break in (to the. Watergate) 
and had nothing to do with 
it. And in my opinion, he 
had nothing to do with the 
cover-up." 

Ford told his ,Republican 
audience he fears a "legisla-
tive dictatorship" *,pemo-
crats obtain ov, elming , 
congressional 	ength i n 
this fall's eleCtions. 
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