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led at the French Embassy 
t.)• ay to sign the register for 

esident Pompidou. 
Mr. Brezhnev was accompa-
ed by Premier Aleksei N. Ko-
gin and Foreign Minister 
drei A. Gromyko. 
The Soviet Union has not yet 
nounced who will attend the 
morail service in Paris. 

Chou in Act of Homage 
EKING, April 4 (Reuters)— 

P mien Chou En-lai led a high-
ranking group of Chinese lead-
ers to the French Ambassador's 
residence here today to sign a 
book of condolence in memory 
of Mr. Pompidou. 

‘AAA,A. 

t say, a monument," Mr. 
ompidou said in his hand-

written instructions. 
Saturday has been declared 

a day of national mouring. 
Most shops will be closed dur-
na-the Notre Dame service. ri nes gkm 	ja7A 

Nixon Oft 	aris °ow -I 
WASHINGTON, April 4 (AP) 

—President Nixon will fly to 
Paris to attend the memorial 
service to Mr. Pompidou on 
Saturday, the White House said 
today. 

Mr. Nixon will leave tomor-
row morning from Washington 
and is expected to return late 
Saturday. 

"The President has no plans  

for substantive meetings with 
other foreign leaders while in 
Paris," said the deputy press 
secretary, Gerald L. Warren. 

Trudeau To Attend 
OTTAWA, April 4 (Canadian 

Press)—Prime Minister Pierre 
Elliott Trudeau leaves for Paris 
tonight aboard a regular armed 
forces flight to attend the 
memorial service for Mr. Pompi-
dou. 

A Tribute in Moscow 
MOSCOW, April 4 (Reuters) 

The Soviet Communist party 
leader, Leonid I. Brezhnev, 


