
Senator Mike Mansfield 
said last night the federal 
ceInts must pursue s`the 
climes of Watergate" for as 
Riag as it takes to deal with 
Nii-con administration scan-
ded s. 

e Senate Democratic 
leader pledged Congress will 
deal fully this year with the 
qhe stion o f impeaching 
president Nixon while giv-
ing first -attention to a legis-
lative agenda aimed at lead-
ing the nation to "a decent 
future." 

Delivering the Democratic 
response t o Mr. Nixon's 
"State of the Union" speech, 
Mansfield rejected the Presi-
dent's statement that "one 
year of Watergate is 
enough" and his plea for a 
prompt end to congressional 
and judicial probes of the 
Scapdal. 

"Whether it is months or 
years," the Montana Demo-
crat said, "there are no judi-
cial shortcuts." 
Mansfield spoke to the na-

tion from his office, across 
the Capitol from the House 
chamber, where Mr. Nixon 
presented his speech to a 
joint session of Congress. 

After his speech, Mans-
field, as Senate majority 
leader and .his party's desig-
nated spokesman to answer 
Mr. Nixon, responded to 
questions from a panel of ra-
dio and television newsmen. 

In 20 minutes, he an-
swered 42 questions from 
the six reporters, declaring: 

• He does not think Wat-
ergate and the move toward 
impeachment have crippled 
Mr. Nixon's ability to gov-
ern.,  

•• He doubts the Senate 
Watergate Committee can 
make its report by the Fe-
bruary 28 deadline because 
of Special Prosecutor Leon 
Jaworski's request to the 
committee to delay publish-
ing its findings in order to 
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gate criminal trials. 
• He favors televising of 

both House and Senate im-
peachm en t prddeedings. 
However, he said, the Sen-
ate, while "watching with 
great interest, what happens 
in the House," has not start-
ed any studies of how it 
would proceed with a trial if 
Mr. Nixon is impeached. 

• He hopes that, "by act-
ing and moving," Congress 
can help overcome the wi-
despread loss of faith in the 
ability of government to 
function properly. 

Mansfield said the con-
gressional election in Nov-
ember will "test the record 
of the past two years" and 
declared that the record of 
Congress last year, while 
"not earthshaking," repre-
sented, "a sustained and sob-
er effort on the part of Re-
publicans and  Democrats 
alike." 

As primary goals irr the 
1974 legislative program, 
Mansfield listed election‘ tax 
and pension reform; health 
insurance, and a minimum 
wage increase. H e ex-
pressed hope that President 
Nixon's $304.4 billion budget, 
due Monday, can be cut. 

He called for public sup-
port for congressional-  ef-
forts to clean up what he 
called "the campaign fi-
nancing mess," and d e-
clared "we shall not finally 
come to grips with the prob-
lem except as we are pre-
pared to pay for the public 
business of elections with 
public funds." 

Mansfield said that "what 
Watergate did to public con-
fidence with regard -to the 
nation's politics, the energy 
crisis has done in the realm 
of the nation's economy." 

He added that "the imme-
diate *responsibility of gov-
ernment is to make certain 
that the shortage does not 
devastate the economy and 
that the price of past neglect 
is borne equitably by all 
Americans. 

"If that means- rationing,  

then let us not nesitate to 
n 	 NI sfield 

said, a con k 	vii Mr. Nixon's vow "to' do ,every-
thing we can to avoid gaso-
line rationing." 

Mansfield said the events 
of the past year "have un-
derscored the wisdom" of 
the nation's judgment in 
1972 when it returned Demo-
crats to control of Congress 
while giving Mr,. Nixon a 
presidential landslide. 

Citing congressional ac-
tion to halt U.S. bombing of 
Cambodia and limit presi-
dential war powers, Mans-; field said the 93rd Congress' 
first session succeeded in acting to limit what he 
termed "an ominous shift to 
one-branch government." 

"The erosion of the sys- 
tem of checks and balances 
was halted," he said. "A 
greater congressional im-
pact began to be registered'  
on all of the basic decisions 
of the federal government'," 

While devoting most of his 
speech to major domestic 
and foreign concerns, Mans-
field raised the Watergate 
question, and what he called 
"the related questions of imp 
peachment and  resigna-
tion," early in his remarks. 

As for the question of res-
ignation, Mansfield s a i d: 
"The President has stated 
his intentions bluntly in that 
regard" by vowing to serve 
out the remainder of his sec-
ond four year term. 

"Insofar as the Congress 
is concerned," Mansfield ad-
ded, ''that closes the matter 
of resignation." 

"Impeachment is the re-
sponsibility of the Congress," 
Mansfield added, declaring 
"it is being handled properly 
and deliberately." 

In what amounted to a 
pledge to make sure the 
matter is resolved one way 
or another by the end of 1974 
and not permitted to drag 
on, he said: "I would antici-
pate that it will be dealt 
with fully in this session." 

Mansfield said, "The ques-
tion of impeachment and the 
matters of the Watergate 
hearings create onerous re-
sponsibilities for the Con-
gress. 

"As for the crimes of Wa-
tergate — and there were 
crimes," Mansfield s a i d, 
"they cannot be put to rest 
by Congress. Nor can any 
ward s of the 

- from me mitigate them. 
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Presidents '     or 

"The desposition of 'crimes 
is a function of the Juslice 
Department 	a n d the 
courts," he continued, de-
claring that as far as he can 
tell, Special Prosecutor Leon 
Jaworski "is doing his job 
and so, too, are the amts." 
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