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V , EHRLICHMAN 
CALLED 'SIGNIFICANT' 

Special to The New York Times 

WASHINGTON, Jan. 10 -
John D. Ehrlichman, former 
domestic adviser to President 
Nixon, is in Washington this 
week on what his lawyer has 
called a "significant" visit. 

Mr. Ehrlichman resigned 
from the White House staff 
April 30 and returned to Seat-
tle to practice law. He has 
since made a number of trips 
to Washington and has ap-
peared before one of the grand 
furies investigating the Water-
gate scandals. 

John J. Wilson, Mr. Ehrlich-, 
man's lawyer, said the former 
White House aide arrived Sun-
day and planned to leave Sat-
urday. 

Asked the purpose of the 
visit by United Press Interna-
tional, Mr. Wilson said, 
guess you'd call it significant." 

Mr. Ehrlichman has been in-
dicted under California laws in 
a burglary-conspiracy case that 
grew out of a break-in in Sep-
tember, 1971, at the Beverley 
Hills office of Dr. Lewis F. 
Fielding. Dr. Fielding, a psy-
chiatrist, had treated Dr. Dan-
iel Ellsberg, central figure in 
the Pentagon Papers trial. The 
burglars sought files on Dr. 
Ellsberg. 


