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The more they thought --water upon which our court- 
about Jerry Ford, the, more try depends," said his. 

ksend, hell George Mahon 
f Texas, who probably 

holds as much power as ap 
propriations chairman as 
Ford enjoyed as minority 
leader. 

The remark was meant as 
a compliment, but it also de-
scribed the limits of Ford's 
work-a-day reputation in the 
capital's politics—a reliable 
lineman in a town Ivbere 
quarterbacks get the head-
lines. He Aras nobody's 'su-
perstar. 

Then, day by day, ea= con-
gressmen and senators', and 
other political leaders -*came 
forward to assess the" Man, 
the idea of "Vice President 
Ford" sounded better and 
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better to them and—who 

4%.knows—even 	"President 
?, Ford" has a certain ring to 

it. 
"I have known Jerry Ford 

for many years," said Michi-
' Ban's Sen. Philip Hart, as  

liberal as Ford is conserva-
live. "During that time, we 
have often disagreed, but I 
have never had reason to 
doubt his integrity and his '  
sincerity. As for his voting 
record, I suspect he views 
mine in about the same 
light I.view his, but in this 

Lperiod of swift change only 
l'the foolhardy offers his own 
voting record as a standard 
of wisdom and consistency." 

Rep. Paul N. McCloskey 
of California, a wayward 
liberal who has often strayed 

from Ford's flock confessed: 
"I am puzzled 'sometimes 
over exactly what it is about 
Jerry Ford that causes me 
to like him so well and re-
spect him so much." The ex-
planation, McCloskey decid- 
ed, w a s old-fashioned mid-
western honesty. 
"His word is good, not just 

to the letter of an under-
standing, but in the spirit of 
that understanding," said 
another liberal, Rep. Rich-
ard Bolling of Missouri, the 
intellectual patriarch of 
House reformers. "He is a 
man of strong convictions 
and opinions, but he is also 
a man who truly respects 
the opinions of others." 

Even I Ford's limitations 
were transformed into vir-
tues. His lackluster style 
was described as a welcome 

they thought of him. 
He defied the percent- 

ages. Usually, when a public 
figure submits himself to re-
lentless scrutiny in Wash-
ingben, it diminishes him. 
Long-buried skeletons pop 
out of closets, old embarrass-
ing speeches come back to 
haunt him. 

But Gerald Rudolph Fort 
Jr., a plain man of comforta-
ble familiarity, actually 
grew in personal stature as 
he moved methodically 
through the investigations 
and hearings which ended 
yesterday with his confirma-
tion as the nation's 40th 
Vice President. 

"He is one of those hew-
ers of wood and- drawers of 

 

 

 

tonic for a populace sick of 
flashy rhetoric. "Thank God 
he's got character, not char-
isma," a Democratic county 
chairman from California 
wrote to Sen. Alan Cran- 
ston. "We've had too much 
of the one, too little of the 
other." 

Ford's modest intellect 
was described as a down-to-
earth sense of the practical. 
The old LBJ wisecrack—the 
one about Jerry Ford play-
ing too much football with-
out a helmet—drew a 
thoughtful response from a 
California Republican 
leader: 

"Things might be better if 
Richard Nixon had made 
that Whittier football team. 
Thank God Gerald Ford 
made the Michigan team. 
He's strong and he knows it. 
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tie's tough and he knows it. 
He won't have to prove his 
manhood. And I'm not 
thinking only about Nixon 
when I say that—look at his 
predecessor. Thank God, 
too, that Ford wasn't a quar- 
terback. He knows he 
doesn't know all the an- 
swers." 

The bouquets for Ford be- 
came so thick and fragrant 
that Rep. Joe Waggoner, a 
Louisiana Democrat who 
has often worked with Ford 
to block liberal measures, 
couldn't resist teasing the 
minority leader. 

"I've heard so many nice 
things about you," Wag-
goner told Ford, "I've con-
cluded you've got to be a 
fairy—you couldn't be real." 

A small, persistent band 
of liberals felt the same 
way. After all, this was the 
same Jerry Ford they in-
sisted, who tried to impeach 
Supreme Court Justice Wil-
liam O. Douglas a couple of 
years ago, who has stuck 
doggedly to partisan attacks 
on almost every issue, who 
voted against most of the 
major social legislation of 
the last decade, and who 
tried to weaken every im-
portant civil rights bill. 

"They'll rue the day," 
warned Rep. Don Edwards, 
a liberal Democrat from 
California. "He is going to 
be a bad President. He's 
more conservative than 
Nixon and his judgment's 
not as good." 

For the overwhelming ma-
jority, however, the confir-
mation of Ford by both 
House and Senate, estab-
lished . this principle: that 
partisan and ideological 
preferences must give way 
to another standard of judg-
ment, the personal quality 
of the man, regardless of his 
views. On that scorecard, 
Jerry Ford stood remarka-
bly high. 

Senator Cranston, who 
canvassed hundreds of Cali-
fornians from both parties 
on the nomination, was 
struck by the non-partisan 
tone of the responses from 
both Republicans and Demo-
crats, as well as their as-
sumption that confirming 
Ford may well be choosing 
the next President—if Mr. 
Nixon continues to slide. 
Cranston concluded: 

"I doubt if there has ever 
before been a time when in-
tegrity has so surpassed ide-
ology in the judging of a 
man for so high an office in 
our land." 

A prominent California 
businessman passed on this 
story: a wealthy Michigan 
industrialist who is a friend 
of his has several times of-
fered to let Ford share in  

some legitimate and promis-
ing real estate deals. Each 
time, Ford politely declined. 

In the confirmation hear-
ings, old allegations of influ-
ence-peddling made by a 
small-bore Washington hus-
tler named Robert Winter-
Berger were examined 
closely and rejected as 
empty, even by the sternest 
Ford critics. In Ford's home 
district of Grand Rapids, 
even his 1972 Democratic 
opponent, attorney Jean 
McKee, told Ralph Nader's 
investigators that nobody 
took Winter-Berger's charg-
es seriously because of 
Ford's own impeccable rep-
utation. 

"He would have to be ac-
tually caught smuggling her-
oin into the country or 
something," she said, "he 
has such an image of believ-
ability. I think he's probably 
as clean as anyone can be." 
In the year of Watergate, 
that quality turns out to be 
the most important one. 

Charles Goodell, the for-
mer congressman and sena-
tor who helped Ford reach 
the GOP House leadership, 
put it this way: 

"Should anything happen 
to the President, a Ford ad-
ministration would be solid, 
honest, open and believable. 
We could do worse—and 
have." 
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When Gerald R. Ford was 
born on July 14 in Omaha, 
Neb., 60 years ago, his name 
was Leslie King. His parents 
divorced when he was still 
an infant and his mother 
moved to Grand Rapids 
where she remarried. Ger-
ald R. Ford Sr., a small busi-
nessman, adopted the boy, 
gave him his name and 
raised him as his own. Tom 
LaBelle, a reporter for the 
Grand Rapids Press, discov-
ered that Jerry Ford grew 
almost to manhood unaware 
he had another father, a 
rancher in Wyoming. 

Jerry was a senior in high 
school, working for $2 a 
week at Bill Skougis's res-
taurant, when his real fa-
ther came to town. 

"He stands there and he 
keeps looking at me for a 
long time," Ford remem-
bered. "I was washing 
dishes and serving hamburg-
ers and making change. Fi-
nally, he walked over to me 
and he said, 'I'm your fa-
ther.' 

"That was quite a shock. 
I'd never thought about it. I 
couldn't care less. From my 
earliest days, I always as-
sumed that my stepfather 
was my real father." • 

Both men are dead now. 
So is his Mother. Congress-
man Ford remembers that 



the last time he wept was at 
her funeral in 1966. 

As a boy, big and growing 
and athletic, he thought he 
would be a profess,onal 
baseball player. In his ado-
lescent years, when Clar-
ence Darrow was a sensa-
tional figure, his head was 
turned toward the court-
room and politics. 

He was a teen-age 
achiever—an Eagle Scout,  
captain of the football team, 
honored by the governor. 
But he was no saint, as he 
liked to point out. Once, 
caught "doping off" in 
school, the principal gave 
hini a tongue lashing, but 
Jerry thought it was unjust, 
so he didn't bother to tell 
his folks. 

"The principal was an old 
and dear friend of my fa-
ther's," Ford recalled, "so I 
got it twice." 

His father started a small 
paint and varnish factory in 
Grand Rapids. The business 
survived, but never brought 
in so much that Jerry and 
his three step-brothers 
didn't have to work. After 
his brilliant career as an 
All-America center on the 
football team at the Univer-
sity of Michigan, Ford had 
to choose between profes-
sional football and law 
school. He chose Yale. 

"The reason was purely 
pragmatic," he confessed. "I 
could make $2,400 as a Yale 
assistant ioach and also go 
to law school or I could 
make $2,0* with the Green 
Bay. Patkers or the Detroit 
Lions." 

Bill Proxmire, future Wis-
consin senator, 'vas boxing 
on the Yale team when 
Jerry lord was in law 
school ;and helped coach 
freshmin boxing and junior 
varsity, football. A square 
and sod guy, .Proxmire re-
members, but he. adds 
"Jerryhever got in the ring 
with $. He really wasn't 
much at a boxing coach. He 
was going to law school and 
he needed the job." 

Amdrig other things, 
Ford's' hometown newspaper 
unearthed a bit of nostalgia 
from 'that period in his life 
—a Look magazine picture 
spread which features a 
handsome young Yalie 
named Jerry Ford squiring 
a New York model on a pic-
ture-book ski weekend in 
Vermont. 

"A New York Girl and her 
Yale Boy Friend Spend a Hi-
larious Holiday on Skis," 
Look proclaimed, with lots' 
of silly pictures of the fu-
ture Veep frolicking in the 
snow. 

He is still an athlete—ski-
ing at his place in Vail, 
Colo., and swimming from 

March to November in the 
heated backyard pool in Al- 
exandria, Va. His occasional 
partner, George Mahon, of- 
fers this assessment of the 
Vice President's golf game: 

"He knocks the ball a 
country mile, but his short 
game leaves much to be de-
sired." 

From Yale, Ford went to a 
brief law practice back 
home, then the aircraft car-
rier USS Monterrey serving 
in the Pacific, then -back to 
Grand Rapids and another 
law firm. 

His first race for Congress 
was in 1948. He was styled a 
modern Republican and he 
defeated the isolationist in- 
cumbent Bartel Jonkman. 
That same autumn, he mar-
ried Elizabeth Bloomer, who 
is Betty Ford to Wishingtoni-
ans and now the mother of 
four children. 

Ford's own description of 
his political viewpoint is: 
"Internationalist in foreign 
policy, conservative in fiscal 
affairs, and a moderate in 
general domestic matters." 

A lot of his colleagues 
think that sounds too bland. 
He is strongly oriented to 
defense interests and big 
business, generally. Yet, as 
minority leader, he helped 
guide the GOP toward a 
broader policy perspective 
on the environment, reve-
nue sharing and other issues 
during the middle 1960s 
when the Democrats held 
the White House. 

Ford's strongest card, 
however, has been his qual-
ity as a legislative leader, 
the ability to marshal his 
troops without gathering an 
army of enemies. Consider-
ing that he has presided 
over House Republicans for 
nine years, it is extraordi-
nary that they all speak so 
well of him even in private, 
not to mention the .friendly 
Democrats. 

"He is not a man of imagi-
nation or humor," said Sen. 
Proxmire,-and a lot of con-
gressmen probably would go 
along with that assessment. 
But they see compensating 
qualities. Rep. Martha Grif-
fiths, a Michigan Democrat, 
described the change when 
Rep. Charles Halleck was re-
placed by Ford as GOP 
leader: 

"Where Mr. Halleck was 
swift and ruthless, Gerald 
Ford was slow-moving, soft-
spoken and knd. Some con-
fused such act.o_is with an 
inability to lead. They were 
wrong." The ev,.,inc:, she 
noted, :s that, w th on:: ex-
ception, House Republicans 
have managed to sustain ev-
ery Nixon veto this tear. 

Joe Waggonner, who has  

often led Southern conserva-
tives into coaliton with 
Ford's conservative Republi-
cans, gives him high marks 
as a tactician: 

"He is practical. He al-
ways knew when the horses 
were there and when they 
weren't." 

Rep. John Erlenborn, a 
conservative 	Republican 
from Illinois, describes how 
floor leader Ford squeezes a 
colleague for, a vote: 

"Only in the nicest way. 
He'll say, 'If you can possi- 
bly go along, I appreciate it.' ' 
But there's never any arm- 
twisting or threats. None of 
this business about a project 
in your district." 

Ford, some of them say, 
also has a stubborn streak 
and the habit of occasionally 
stating things rather 
crudely in order to make his 
point. 

Once, during debate on 
the Alaska pipeline, he per-
sisted in referring to Can-
ada as a "hostile power," 
much to the embarrassment 
of his colleagues. 

Inevitably, now that Ford 
is Vice President, his old 
colleagues wonder about 
what kind of a President he 
might make, a possiblity 
which is fast moving beyond 
the category of idle specula-
tion. They are comfortable 
with the thought—even 
heartened by it. 

"His whole life has been 
in Congress," said a Demo-
cratic committee chairman 
who came to Washington in 
the same period, "so he 
Wouldn't try to run over 
Congress the way Nixon has. 
He might be more stubborn 
on some things, but he 
wouldn't be devious." 

Rep. Donald Riegle, a con-
verted Democrat from Mich-
igan, who still warmly 
praises his old GOP leader, 
observed: 

"Jerry Ford has often 
played the role of partisan 
battering ram and many 
prop..xly wonder if he can 
rise above narrow partisan-
ship. I believe he can and 
will, but clearly it will re-
quire him to reverse per-
sonal behavior patterns long 
established." 

Ford himself has prom-
ised to play • the role of 
.:`ready conciliator and calm 
communicator between 
White House and Capitol. 
During confirmation hear-
ings, he spoke against se 
crecy in government and for 
candor. 

"Truth is the glue on the 
bond that holds government 
together," Gerald Ford said. 

If he becomes President, a 
lot of people will try to 
make him stick to those 
words. 


