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White House 
Aide Harlow 
To Quit Post 

Washington 

Presidential adviser Bryce 
N. Harlow yesterday con-
firmed reports h e soon 
would be leaving his White 
House post. 

He said no exact date 'ha  
been set for his departure 
but it would be "relatively 
soon." 

The 57-year-old political 
expert who served for eight 
years as a deputy assistant 
t o President Eisenhower, 
said he was not leaving out 
of dissatisfaction with the 
Nixon White House. 

"L had a complete undir-
standing with the President 
when I came back that it 
was on a temporary basis," 
he said, nothing it has been 
six months since he was re-
called to government ser-
vice from his job as a vice 
presdent of Proctor & Gam-
ble. 

Harlow was called to the 
Nyiaite House last June along 
with former defense secre-
tary Melvin R. Laird to help 
Mr. Nixon re-establish his 
Watergate-'zhattered staff 
and repair relations with 
Congress. 

Laird also disclosed this 
week he would be returning 
to private life soon. 
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