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New England Teachers' Seminar on Watergate Ends 
By GENE I. MAEROFF 

Special to The New York Times 
SCARBOROUGH, Me., Oct. 

28 — A teachers' conference 
here that began as a discussion 
of how to teach about Water-
gate ended as a lesson in activ-
ism yesterday with leaders 
from throughout New England 
calling for the impeachment of 
President Nixon. 

Five of the six presidents of 
the region's state affiliates of 
the National Education Associ-
ation, a 1.2-million-member or 
ganization representing most of 
the country's elementary and 
secondary school teachers, were 
among the 25 signers of a peti-
tion for impeachment. Catha-
rine Barrett, who was the 
national president of the N.E.A. 
last year, was also a signer. 

The document was intended 
as a device by which to begin 
mobilizing the entire member-
ship of the once-conservative 
National Education Association 
behind impeachment. 

"The question now is wheth-
er we are going to let the 
fruits of today's meeting fritter 
away," Mrs. Barrett said as the 
teacher leaders were weighing 
the advisability of backing im-
peachment. "Is time going to 
run out before the educators 
of this country speak on this 
important issue?" 

The one-day conference, 
sponsored by 'the National Edu-
cation Association and Its local 
affiliates, brought together 135 
New England teachers to dis-
cuss "The Educational Implica-
tions of Watergate." 

Later Development 
After most of the teachers 

had left for the long drive 
home, the conference leaders 
gathered late yesterday after-
noon to talk about what they 
had learned and how to en-
courage similar meetings else-
where in the country. Gradually 
their concern grew more pro-
found, and soon a theoretical 
exercise became a basis for 
action. 

Among those who signed the 
petition, which was hastily 
scrawled on a yellow legal pad, 
were Arthur S. Coley, president 
of the Connecticut Education 
Association; Joan E. Flanagan, 
president of the Massachusetts 
Teachers Association; Donald 
Murphy, president of the New 
Hampshire Education Associa-
tion, and Charles Sanders, 
president of the Maine Teach-
ers Association. 

Teacher leaders from Ver-
mont did not attend the con-
ference. Those who signed the 
petition said they did so as 
individuals and not on behalf 
of their organizations, which 

they say they will now try to 
get to follow suit. 

The unlikely setting for what 
the teachers consider a historic 
event was a race track, Scar-
borough Downs. 

In the spacious clubhouse of 
the race track, which has com-
pleted its season, the teachers 
found themselves discussing 
morality while surrounded by 
$2 win, place and show win-
dows. 

"Maybe it would have been 
more appropriate to draft our 
petition on the back of the Rac-
ing Form" commented Mr. Di-
Orio of Rhode Island. 

But there. was on the whole 
little joking. The teachers met 
in various seminars devoted to 
such questions as how to com-
bat the attitude that politics is 
a dirty business, can teachers 
afford to teach the truth about 
recent political history, and how 
to combat the idea that indivi-
duals are impotent to affect 
major issues. 

The tone of the conference 
was set in an opening speech 
by Representative Margaret M. 
Heckler, Republican of Massa-
chusetts, who said that "there 
has been . an erosion of confi-
dence spreading like a cancer 
through this country." 

"It is terribly relevant for 
educators to face the questions 
of Watergate and to think 
about how to rekindle faith in 
our Government, in our coun- 

ident Nixon is deceitful and 
they want to know what, I 
think," said Joanne Cortellino, 
a young fifth-grade teacher in 
Amherst, N.Y. "How do I 
answer them without having 
the wrath of the community on 
my head?" 

Jacqueline Johnson, a fifth-
grade teacher in Sanford, Me., 
remarked that she thought 
forthrightness was the best 
policy. 

"We were discussing im-
peachment reecntly in connec- 

tion with Andrew Johnson," 
said Mrs. Johnson, "and 'then 
we related it to Mr. Nixon's 
situation. The children asked 
me, 'What do you think?' and 
I said that I was frightened 
when I thought about impeach-
ment and its implications. 

"Then they asked me, 'Did 
you vote for him?' and I said 
that I did because at the time 
I thought that he would be a 
good President, but that I 
wouldn't vote for him today. 
That was being honest. I'm still 
waiting for the repercussions." 

 

 

  

   

try," Mrs. Heckler continued. 
"The sense of confidence can 
be engendered by the way you 
tell students what power to the 
people really means." 

While Mrs. Heckler was criti-
cal of the Nixon Administration, 
she did not call for impeach-
ment. But the next speaker, Mrs. 
Barrett, a former Syracuse, N. Y., 
teacher, did. 

"How in the world can the 
Congress of the United States 
suffer this man's absolute ob-
struction of justice in forbid-
ding anyone to investigate 
him?" Mrs. Barrett asked in 
connection with the President 
and his dismissal of Archibald 
Cox, the special Watergate 
prosecutor. "He should be im-
peached. Only in that way will 
the Senate be able to bring out 
all of the facts on the sorry, 
sordrid affairs." 

In the seminar sessions that 
followed, most of the teachers 
seemed to feel that Watergate 
could be utilized as an excellent 
teaching tool to help pupils 
learn about the functions and 
malfunctions of government..  

"We are witnessing one of 
the best classroom lessons we 
have ever had," said Dr. John 
Marvin, the executive secretary 
of the Maine Teachers Associa-
tion. "Yet security dictates that 
a lot of teachers will still teach 
Chapter 8." 

Dr. Marvin's admonition 
against continuing to teach 

from the textbook instead of 
from current events was ap-
parently a reference to the 
Plight of those teachers who are 
are said to fear that they might 
be repriinanded by principals, 
superintendents and parents if 
they were to deal with 
Watergate. 

Continually arising in the 
seminars was the idea that 
teachers must be assured of 
academic freedom to have free-
dom of expression in the class-
room. It was felt that strong 
teachers' organizations, willing 
and able to stand behind in-
dividual teachers in times of 
adversty, were essential if 
such controversial topics as 
Watergate were discussed. 

Of major concern to many of 
the teachers was the question 
of how much they should per-
mit their own opinions of the 
Watergate events to come into 
the open in their teaching. 

"Some of the kids in my 
fifth-grade class say that Pres- 

  

  

  

  

   

  

   

  

   

  

   

  

   

  

   

in Call for Impeachment 


