
Tax Evasion Charge 

Dennocrat Indicted in Baltimore 
Baltimore.. • ., 

The special grand jury -
investigating allegatiOns 
o f contract kickbacks 
against Vice President 
Spiro Agnew heard more 
testimony yesterday and 
returned a new indictment 
against N. Dale Anderson, 
the Democrat who suc-
ceeded Agnew as the C01.111- 
1 y executive of suburban 
F',altimore county. 

In addition to the 39-count 
indictment brought against 
Anderson last August 23, the 
grand jury yesterday voted 
four more counts charging 
him with attempting i  in 
evade federal income tax. 
payments from I369 through 
Iffi2 

The four .counts. asserting.  
that Anderson had under-
stated the tax due by $68.-.  
000. were returned in the 
courtroom of U.S. Distric' 
Judge Frank A. Kaufman. 
The indictment charges 

that Anderson had failed to 
report more than S..'110.000 of 
taxable income during the 
four-year period. nearly ali 
of it earned in 1970 and 1972. 

INDIMIENTS 

In the August 23 indict- 
ment. 	Anderson 	w a s 
charged with receiving 
46.420 i n kickback pay-

ments from eight engineer-
ing. • architectural- and con-
sulting firms doing business 
with t h e county. 

Vice President Agnew's.  

lawyers. meanwhile, took no 
visible steps yesterday to 
subpoena, the Justice De-
partment officials and new.;-
men frony whOin they hope 
to extract, under oath, the 
identity of the government 
prosecutors whom Agnew 
has accused of "maliciously 
and illegally" leaking &- 
tails of the -grand jury prote 
of his affairs. 

The assertion that he has 
been the victim of prejudi-
cial publicity, inspired by 
news leaks from federal pra-
secutors. is a major part of 
Agnew's argument before 
U.S. District .Judge Walter 

Hoffman that the grand 
jury proceedings here have 

1)T e n "poisoned" against-
him and should be halted by 
the court, without further in-
vestigation and without in-
dictment.  

FRIEND 
Ormsby S. Moore, long-

time friend and former hey 
aide to Agnew when he was 
county executive, was seen 
entering the courthouse yes-
terday morning with his at-
torney. 

Another witness to appear 
yesterday was Eugene Y. 
Hsi of Hsi Associates, a con-
sulting engineering firm that 
has received consulting con-
tracts from the Baltimore 
county and state, govern-
ments. 
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