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Archibald Cox, the Wa- 
tergate special proseaitor, 
charged yesterdayateesi-
dent Nixon could not be 
"a proper judge" of wheth-
er the public interest re-
quires him to release tape 
recordings of White House 
conversations to a grand 
jury investigation. 

In a brief filed in U.S. )is-
trict Court yesterday/  fox 
noted that the Pre dent's 
"highest and closest aides 
and associates have I Z,  -n ac-
cused in sworn test •'. ony" 
before the Senate coi s a, ttee 
headed by Senator Sam J. 
Ervin Jr. 	 4 t:', 

l't The President, (,O,'3' de-
clared, "is bound to ithem 
not'Ionly by the naturaremo-
bons 'of loyalty and grati-
itide but also by the risk that-
his present political power 
and future place in history 
will be linked to the effect of 
disclosure to the grandlm'y 
on them. 

"The evidence on the tapes 
also may be material to 
public accusations against 
the respondent (Mr. Nixon) 
himself," the Cox brief con-
tinued, "a question to' eh 
he Can hardtbe incliff et. 

n 

We 'call att tion to 	ese 
facts without 'disrespect to 
the respondent or his off-
ice." 

CONFIDENCE 
Even if 'Mr. Nixon'could 

disregard his own stake in 
the dispute, the prosecutor 
declared, "confidence in the 
integrity and impartiality of 
the legal system, as between 
the high and lowly, still 
would be impaired through 
violation of the ancient pre-
cept that no man shill be 
the judge of his own cause." 
`,The Cox brief was the la-

test move in the prosecu-
tor's attempt to win a court 
decision forcing the Presi-
dent to hcinor a subpoena 
and make the tapes availa-
bl . It was a 67-page re-
s se to a White House brief 
fi e last Tuesday; after a 
White House reply on Fri-.... 

dax, the case win be argued 
on August .2244'1°  

P NTS 
esterday's legal state-
nt, the first full exposi-

of the proSecutor's case 
nst the President, made 

these major points: 
▪ Mr. Nixon's lawyers' 

assertion that the ,F'resdient 
has "the power and,thus the 
priyileg,e to withhold infor-

tion" on the basis of his 
judgment "runs con-

ary to our entire constitu- 
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tio*1 tradition" by equating 
p4sical power with legal 
privilege. 

• The President waived 
any right of confidentiality 
he may have enjoyed as to 
the White House conversa-
tions, permitting "a flood of 
irivmplete and contradicto-
ry testimony" and adding in 

e cases, "his own ver- 
o . Now the respondent 

(the President)" asserts a 
privilege to withhold the 

More Watergate news 
on Page 9 

most complete record avail-
able to supplement faulty re-
collections, resolve contra-
dictions and fill in'important 
details," the Cox brief de-
clared. "The law is not so 
capricious." 

• Making the tapes avail-
able Jo the grand jury now 
will ,n o t threaten future 
Presidents' access to ,free 
a ncf candid advice from 
aides because "surely there 
will be few occasions upon 
which a grand jury will have 
similar, cause t o believe 
there is material evidence of 
criminality of high officials 
in the papers and documents 
in the executive offices of 
the President." 

• The President does not 
have any absolute "execu-
tive privilege" to withhold 
information, and the courts, 
rather than the President, 
have the power to decide 
when his qualified privilege 
outweights the public inter-
est in making such facts 
avaikble. 

QUOTES 
The Cox brief quoted from 

a 1971,,,, decision of the U.S. 
Court otAppeals for the Dis-
trict of Columbia, which 

held that an executive ae-
partment official could not 
be given "absolute authority 
to determine what docu-
ments in his possession" 
should be permitted to come 
before the court. 

"Otherwise," the  court 
said; "the head of any exe-
cutive department would 
have' the power on his own 
say-so to cover up all evi-
dence of fraud and corrup-
tion when a federal court or 
grand jury was investigating 
malfeasance in office, and 
this is not the law." 

As Cox filed his' papers, 
lawyers for the Senate Wat-
ergate committee and the 
White House agreed, at least 
tentatively, to speed the 
course of a parallel lawsuit, 
by the committee against 
the President with regard to 
producing some tapes. 

The committee filed its ac-
tion last Thursday,' asking 
that the President be re-
quired to reply in 20 days in-
stead of the 60 normally giv-
en the government. While 
reserving their right to ask 
for more time, the White 
House lawyers acceptedAu-
gust 29 as the date for •An-
swering the • congressional 
suit. 

The special prosecutor, in 
his brief, said it was wrong 
to regard his suit against the 
President "as a struggle be-
tween the powers of the judi-
ciary and the preogatives of 
the President." 

"Rather," he said, "what 
is involved is the respon-
dents refusal to respond to 
a demand from the people, 
speaking through their or-
gan, 'the grand jury. Unlike 
a monarch, the president is 
not the sovereign." 

New Y ork Times 


