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By Harry Reny 
Examiner Washirigton Bureau 
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Ehrlichman or John W. 
Dean III — dispatched one 
of its private eyes, ex-New 
York detective Anthony Ula-
sewicz, to investigate the 
mysterious activities of a 
baby-faced hustler by the 
name of "Simmons." 

Dirty Tricks Network 
Ulasewicz, who also care 

ried out other "discreet in-
vestigations" for the White 
House. learned that "Sim-, 
mons" was the nom do 
guerre of Donald T. Segrsitti). 
hired by Nixon aide Dwight 
Chapin allegedly to establish 
a dirty-tricks network 
against Democrats in major 
primary states. He was in-
dicted this year in the distri-
bution during the Florida 
primary of a bogus letter 
charging Sens. Hilbert Hum, 
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MADISON (Wis.) —Early 
in 1972 — at the time the 
Watergate w a s being 
planned — Republican strat-
egists schemed to-upset the 
Democratic primary in Wis-
consin, expected to be a crit-
ical test in the selection of 
President Nixon's challeng-
er. 

T h e Wisconsin strategy 
was, according to investiga-
tors, part of the same pat-
tern revealed in the New 
Hampshire and Florida pri-
maries — an effort to sabo-
tage the leading Democrats, 
particularly Sen. Edmund 
Muskie, in hopes of provid-
ing Nixon a weak opponent. 

At one point the political 
espionaae activity became 
so• confused in the Badger 
state that apparently not 
even Republicans knew who 
was sabotaging whom. 

After receiving reports 
from Wisconsin, the White 
House — possibly John 
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phrey , and Henry Jackson 
with sexual misconduct. 

The anti-Democratic plan-
n in g included high level 
brainstorming sessions i  In 
the White House, the Justice 
Department and the Com-
mittee to Re-elect the Presi-
dent, according to investiga-
tors. 

Nixon strategists consid-
ered encouraging Republi-
cans to make use of Wiscon-
sin's open primary law and 
cross-over t o vote for 
George McGovern or George 
Wallace on the Democratic 
ballot, according to a forfner 
GOP official. 

"There were also a lot of 
rumors," the official said, 
about secretly inserting 

money into the Wallace and 
McGovern campaigns, par-
ticularly the Wallace cam-
paign. There was enough 
money available. But'I don't 
know that it happened." 

Humphrey Comments 
Sen. Humphrey, a Demo-

cratic contender in the 1972 
primary, said in an inter- _  

view he was told by an out-
spaken Wisconsin ,GOP offi-
cial during a visit to Madi-
son that Republicans had a 
cross-over strategy to vote 
for McGovern. Humphrey 
recalled: 

"I was visiting the Capitol 
Times newspaper, and;ihe 
was introduced to me as a 
Repubilican leader, I flak 
from the legislature and I 
asked him how things were 
going, h o w, people were 
going to vote, and he said 
'You are going to see plen-
ty; we are going to vote for 
McGovern.' He said they 
had a program and every-
thing." Humphrey said he 
doesn't recall the Republi-
can's name. 

How effectual were the 
Republican espionage efforts 
no one is certain. Regular 
Republican and Democratic 
politicians tend to discount 
their importance in the final 
Wisconsin results despite a 
massive crossover vote,  
which catapulted McGovern 
to the front and speeded  

ocratic 	ansfeis they 

paign troubles 000-, s- ' 
are now king pkir- 

11 
missed as confusion in a 
new light and half-suspect-
ing, they were the products 
of sabotage. 

"We may have buried a 
couple Watergates in the 
ponfusion o f our cam-
laigns," said a Humphrey 
adviser, William Connell. 

Fro stein, Muskie's 
dii,director, acknowledged 
'It's difficult to discriminate 
b eeen normal campaign 

n  and what may 
have been induced by Sabo- 

can't say 	primary 
here" ̀teas '4obviously sabo-
taged, that we should hive 
won it but the Committee to 
Re-elect the President took 
it away from us," he said. 
"But there were too many 
things that caused discomfit-
ure to be coincidence." 

He recalled phony tele-
phone calls to newsmen an-
nouncing falsely that a Mus-
kie event had been can-
celed o r the location 
changed. 

In Fromstein's view what 
p nally hurt Muskie most 

vicious mailings in 
aukee's Polish wards, 

areas that he was expected 
to carry but didn't. 

The mailings, Fromstein 
d, accused Muskie's 
dfather of fleeing Po-

' land to avoid military se.rv-
icef-and then adding in so 
many words, "no wonder 
I.\ Inside's against the war, he 

' c onies -from a long line of 
- draft dodgers." "They were 

1 	y dropped in areas 
wh e Polish nationalism or 
Amlirican patriotism would 
be 'erou.sed," he said. 

Regis Goyke, a Humphrey 
campaign official in Wiscon-
sin, recalled that three days 
before the primary about 
20,000.bogus, circulars went 
out in Milwaukee's black 
section announcing that the 
Senator and Mrs. Martin Lu-
ther King would hold a re-
ception with free beer and 
lunch. A lot of disappointed 
and angry people showed 

Intercepted Letter 
ke also claims that he 

in 	'ted a letter "from a 
Repu can chairman in one 
of the suburbs" urging party 

members to cross-over and 
vote for McGovern "as the 
weakest Democrat." Goyke 
said he no longer has the let- 
ter wEich he said disap-
peared from his desk prima-
ry night. 

Some •Democrats:fink 
Nixon strategists, no longer 
worried about primary chal-
lenges frmi. liberal Paul 
McCloskey or conservative 
John Ashbrook, encouraged 
a massive Wisconsin 
cross-over vote by suddenly 
shutting off the Nixon televi-
siou advertising. 

On March 14, Milwaukee 
adman Charles Davis, Nixon 
campaign director in the 
state, explained an early 
rush of TV commercials for 
the President b y saying, 

ur objective is to keep a; 
Nixon' presence throughout% 
the entire campaign 
there are going, to be six guys o n the other side 
knocking hell out of Ihe 
Presileet." 

But a week later, the Nix-
on committee announced it 
was halting the TV cam-
paign. 

Democrats immediately 
seized on, the change of tac-
tic as hm.effort to build a crossover ,Vote that would 
hurt Muskie and Humphrey. 
The Republicans said they 
were just saving money. 

When the vote came in, 
M 	vern finished first' (3O 
pe ept); Wallace second 
(22,ercent); Humphrey 
third (21 percent); Muskie 
fourth (10 percent) and the 
others trailed out behind. 

Analysts estimated that 
almost one-third of the votes 
in the Democratic primary 
,,e1 been cast by Republi-cans'. 
One of them, Louis Bean, 

wrote "If . . . Republicans 
are put on their own side of 
the fence" Humphrey would 
have won with 21 percent 
followed by McGovern with 
20 percent and Wallace and 
Muskie with 11 percent each. 



• 

Muskie's end. 
Look in Wonder 

And many doubt that the 
Wisconsin grand strategy 
got very far beyond the 
drawing boards in confer-
ences between Jeb S. Ma- 

, gruder, the No. 2 man in the 
re-election committee, and 
his chief of research, Robert 
Marick, as well as others, 
possibly former Atty. Gen. 
John Mitchell, according to 
a former Republican party 
official. 

But Humphrey and Mus- 

kie glipporters Wok back in 
wonder 'at the chaos of their 
campaigns: leaked secrets, 
phony telephone calls, twist-
ed schedules, thousands of 
Humphrey campaign leaf-
lets left to rot in aMilwau-
kee post office, stolen sta-
tionary, •circulars slandering 
Muskie's patriotism and 
forebearers. 

"There was such unbeliev-
able confusion and it was so 
successful that it had to be 
more than confusion," said 
Mitchell Fromstein, a Mil-
waukee advertising official 
who was media director for 
IVIuslue's Wisconsin cam-
paign. "It looked to melike 
someone was picking the 
weak spots in our line sand 
sending in their toughest 
back with the ball." 

Eric Wuennenberg, a Pi-
mor at the University of 
Wisconsin, was approached 
early 'in 1972 by another 
Youtig Republican. He said 
he was asked "If I would be 
interested in doing any espi-
onage work such as disturb-
ing public appearances and 
planting people in the offices 
of Democratic canclidqes" 
in the primary campaign. 

Wuennenberg identified 
his contact as Charles Svih-
lik, an Inslianapolis college 
student 'end part-time-  gun 
dealer active in Young.Re-
publican affairs. 

Spy Agent 
Government investigators 

say they believe Svihlik was 
a Midwest spy agent for the 
Nixon campaign strategists. 

Svihlik, in turn, had been 
approached by "a guy 
named Simmons" — Segret-
ti; the little agent provoca-
teur and college friend of 
Nixon Administration stal-
warts Dwight Chaffin and 
Presidential News Secretary 
Ronald Ziegler. 
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"Muside was a prime tar-
get" of the .„espionage ef- 

fftAt 	wims taieewgneb eorfg 	lbee- 

fore Muslde's disastrous pri-
mary showings, the 'Maine 
Senator was the DemOcratic 
front runner and led Nixon 
in public opinion polls. Thus 
he was considered a threat-
enieg figure by Nixon strat-
egists. 

Although the University of 
Wisconsin had the reputa-
tion for having some of the 
most rabid anti-war and 
anti-establishment students 
in the country .—.° and thus 
had been avoided by nation-
al Politicians — Muskie de-
cided to brave a visit. 

In a sweaty Loraine Hotel 
hall, a few blocks from the 
campus,,,,Muskie faced a 
packed:lit6Se the-  evening of 
Feb.' 4. 'He was jeered, hec-
kled and offered a mari-
juana 'cigarette. Most of the 
disturbances came from a 
group:that others in the au-
dience said were not stu-
dents. 

Sent Clips 
Wuennenberg sent clip-

pings of news reports of 
these demonstrations t o 
Sviblik, "as if to gain credit 
for 	eating the distur- 
bandes. Wunnenberg said he 
received $25 from Svihlik. 

B u t Wuennenberg now 
claims that it was all a joke 

"al, chance to rip off" the 
Nixon campaign. He said he 
was not responsible for the 
disruptions but told Svihlik 
they were "something we 
could take credit for." 

Wuennenberg said he con-
tributed. the $25 to Demo-
cratic candidates and later 
went to work for McGovern 
in TIlinois. He denies he was 
acting as a Nixon undercov-
er agent in the McGovern 
campaign. 

Svihlik refused in a tele-
phone interview to discuss 
his role "on the advice of 
my lawyers." 

Both he and Wuennenberg 
refused to say or insisted 
they didn't know how many 
Republican spies, if any, 
were infiltrated into Demo-
cratic campaigns in Wiscon-
sin. 

"Ask Segretti," Wuennen-
berg said. 

Watergate Backlash 
Part o f the Watergate 

backlash, according to Dem- 


