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Stans' 
Subpoena 
Upheld 
Judge in N.Y. 
Refuses to Bar 
Hill Appearance 

By George Lardner 
and Philip Greer 

Washington Post Staff Writers 

A federal judge in New 
York yesterday refused to 
block former Commerce 
Secretary Maurice H. Stans' 
subpOeria to appear before 
the Senate Watergate Com-
mittee despite claims that 
the publicity would preju-
dice his criminal trial. 

At a similar hearing here, 
U.S. District Court Judge John 
J. Sirica hinted strongly that 
he would reject a plea to black 
out radio and television ocher-
age of key Senate testimony 
by two other witnesses: former 
White House counsel John W. 
Dean III and Jeb Stuart Ma-
gruder, former deputy direc-
tor of President -Nixon's re-
election campaign. 

The restrictions on news 
coverage of Dean's and Magru-
der's expected confessions 
were sought by the govern-
ment's Special Watergate pros-
ecutor, Archibald Cox, on 
grounds that nationwide 
broadcasting of them would 
seriously endanger fair trials 
"at an ,e arly date" for arifkone 
indicted in the Watergate 
scandal, 

Sirica withheld any decision 
until Tuesday, but he repeat-
edly voiced doubts that he had 
the authority to grant Cox's 
request. 

With,  the Watergate grand 
jury still at wrk, Sirica object-
ed that–he was being asked 
to assert himself over 
congressional protests in a 
case where there are "no in-
dictments, no defendants.",  

In an optimistic mood, the 
Watergate committee's

, 
 f 

counsel, Samuel Dash, 0 
later that he expects SOns 
and then Magruder to= be 
called to testify at the inquiry 
sometime next week, with 
Dean to follow. 

Sen. Sam J. Ervin Jr. (ID-
N.C.)„ the committee chair-
man, told reporters on Capitol 
Hill, meanwhile, that the in- _ 

vestigation will be expanded 
to include the- Whites House-
sponsored burglary at the of-
fices of Pentagon paper0:  trial 
figure Daniel Ellsberg'si: psy-
chiatrist and other controver-
sial actions by the Nixon ad-
ministration in the name of 
"national security." 

Ervin had been considering 
introduction of a Senate reso-
lution broadening the commit-
tee's mandate, but he said he 
has shelved that plan. He said 
he has concluded that his com-
mittee' already has aas much 
authority as an eastern poten-
tate." . 

The New Yorleheating was 
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sought by laiVyers for Stans, 
who was indicted with former' 
Attorney General John N. 
Mitchell there May 10 on ob-
struction-of-justice charges in-
volving fugitive financier Rob- 
ert L. Vesco's secret $200,000 
cash contribution last year to 
Mr. Nixon's campaign. The Se- 
curities and Exchange Com-
mission was probing into Ves-
co's financial dealings at the 
time. 

Stans' chief trial lawyer, 
Walter J. Bonner, protested to 
U.S. District Court Judge Lee 
P. Gagliardi that Stans' ap- 
pearance before the Senate 
Watergate committee while 
under indictment "would add 
insult to injury." He main-
tained that Stans' chances for 
a fair trial would be 
"massively prejudiced." 

Another of Stans' lawyers, 
Robert W. Barker, said the 
committee's staff had assured 
him that the "Vesco matter" 
would not be raised at the 
hearing but Barker said that 
"in our view the whole matter 
of Watergate and Vesco is in-
terrelated and cannot be com-
partmentalized." 

Judge Gagliardi was asked 
for "guidance" in light of local 
free-press, fair-trial rules bar- 
ring public statements about 
pending criminal trials. Gag- 
liardi had said May 30 that 
the rules applied to defend-
ants as well as attorneys. 

The New York judge empha-
sized yesterday, however, that 
the rules specifically state 
that they do not apply to leg-, 
islative hearings. 

"I find nothing in the rule ,  
to prohibit such testimony." 
he said in clearing the way for 
Stans' appearance. 

Bonner said he plans to 
move for dismissal of Stans' 
indictment on the grounds 
that publicity has already 
made a fair trial impossible. 
Gagliardi noted that the trial 
is not scheduled to start until 
Sept. 11 and said he would 
consider the problem then. 

At the hearing before Judge 
Sirica here, Phillip B. Hey- 

mann, associate special prose-
cutor under Cox, ontended 
that restrictions on news cov-
erage of Dean's and Magru-
der's appearances could le-
gally be tied to the court or-
ders the :Senate committee is 
seeking that .would grant both 
men immunfty from any pros-
ecution stemming from their 
testimony,. 

Without such restrictions, 
Heymann argued, "the possi- 

bility of. {fair Watergge trials 
at an early date is threatened 
seriously—not hopelessly, but 
seriously." 

Sirica, however, noted that 
"we're dealing with the doc-
trine of the separation of pow-
ers." 

"What 'authority do I have 
to tell the select [Watergate] 
committee they can't televise 
the hearings?" the judge 
asked. "Here we have no in-
dictments, no defendants. We 
are dealing only in supposi-
tions, isn't that true? We don't 
know if the grand jury is go-
ing to indict 1 person or 10." 

Sirica said the situation 
might be 'different if he were 
being asked for a protective 
order involving suspects un-
der actual indictment, but, he 
said, "here there's nothing be-
fore the court." 

With ideal Watergate prose-
cutors Earl J. Silbert, Seyrn-
our Glanzer and Donald 1  
Campbell sitting at the gov- 

ernment table, Heymann ar-
gued that the truth would be 
be served "by a conjunction 
of limited televised hearings 
and prompt trials," but con-
ceded that "some early identi-
fication of defendants" was 
needed. 

When. Sirica pressed him to 
say when indictments might 
be expected, Heymann said he 
could offer nothing firmer 
than U.S. ,Attorney Harold Ti-
tus's recent forecast of 60 to 
90 days—"near the end of the 
summer'—although he said 
there was some chance they 
might be Speeded up. 

"I don't want to over-argue 
my case," Heymann apolo-
gized moments later in start-
ing to reatate the main points 
of his petition. 

"I don't think there's any 
danger of that," Judge Sirica 
told him crisply. 

Heymann cited' both a 1952 
Federal appellate court deci-
sion reversing the conv,iction 
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of an internal revenue collec-
tor in Massachusetts name 
Denis W. belaney Who was 
brought to trial shortly after 
hostile congressional hearings, 
and a 1962 Supreme Court de-
cision overturning the murder 
conviction of a Louisiana man 
whose confession had been 
broadcast several times before 
his trial on a local television 
station. 	 • 

Unrestricted grants of im- 
munity for Dean and Magru-
der's testimony at televised 
hearings, Heymann contended, 
would "combine the difficul-
ties" posed by both those pre-
cedents. 

Dash called the fears 
"totally unfounded" and 
charged that the cases cited 
by the special prosecutor 
"support his arguments as 
strongly as a thread of gos-
samer."   h e   .  

The Senate committee cowl- 
. 

sel said the Delaney decision, 
for example, held only that his 
trial should have been post-
poned until the hostile atmos-
phere of the congressional 
hearings had evaporated. Dash 
said the same rule could easily 
be applied to trial of any 
Watergate defendants, whose 
trials are still months away. 

"Publicity . . . alone has 
never been held by any court 
to prevent prosecution," Dash 
said. He protested that Cox's 
office'was asking the coats' to 
make "a severe invasion of the 
constitutional doctrine of the 
separation of powers" by im-
provising on grants of immu-
nity that, he said, the law 
makes auteniatic upon con-
gressional request. 

Dash called television cover-
age of the Senate hearings 
important both in carrying out 
CongreSs's court-tested right 
to inform the public and in 
building public support for 
whatever remedial legislation 
the committee might recom-
mend. 

In addition, he told Judge 
Sirica, "we have received very 
valuable leads based" cn our 
TV coverage." Asked for de-
tails by newsmen later, Dash 
declined to elaborate. 

Near the close of the hear-
ing, Heymann, in an apparent 
retreat from his original posi-
tion, asked Judge Sirica sim-
ply to grant immunity to Dean 
and Magruder "so long as. the 
testimony is not broadcast 
without their consent." 

Dean's lawyer, Charles Shaf-
fer, and Magruder's attorney, 
James Bierbower, spoke at the 
hearing briefly to waive their 
clients' right to be present. 


