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zis Were Reerilited 
California ballot on a techni-
cality, freeing those- crucial 
votes for President Nixon. 

Payments for the re-regis-
tration drive Were

, 
 author-

ized by Jet), 'Stuart Magru-
der, former national CRP di-
rector, The Washington Post 
learned, and may have in-
volved' then-Attorney Gen-
erallohn.iN. Mitchell. 

The connection between 
CRP and the re-registration 
schenie was established to-
day,in testimony before the 
Senate Watergate commit-
tee by Hugh Sloan Jr., who 
was treasurer of CRP in 
1971 and early 1972.' 

Sloan told-the- committee 
that the $10,000 was given to 

Lyn Nofziger, who later be- 
came director of the re-elec-
tion campaign in California, 
in late 1971. Its purpose, 
Sloan said he later heard 
from "people in the cam-
paign," was "with regard to 
the Wallace primary." 

Nofziger, reached in Sac-
ramento, where' he is now 
running the. 1974 gubernato-
rial campaign of Republican 
Lt. Gov. Ed Reinecke, ac-
knowledged that he received 
the money on the request of 
Magruder to be Passed On to 
a California gp-between for , 
use in the re-registration 
drive: 

See WALtAdt; AS, Col. 1 

• WALLACE, Fi m Al ' 
' That drive, Nofz ger said, 

he brainchild of Robert • 
lAral,-  is, an advert'sing man 
and former Wallace worker 
long., active : intight-wing 

,..L_ . 
causes in Orang -County 
and Los Angeles. 

'B'eb Walters, wl o used to 
be ,a ".member of IP, came 
around to them (Magruder 
and, the Committee or the 
Re-election of the resident) 
and said there wa A way' to 
purge the AIP vo er list so 
thi y wouldn't halve  - enough 
vo ers to qualify P r the Cal-
ifornia ballot," . a4 Not- , 
ziger, who was fdrmerly 
pre.SS secretary to 'alifornia 
Gov.. Ronald Re gan. "He 
(Walters) had talk -d. to Ma-
gruder and Magr der came 
to ne around Sep ember or 
Odober, 1971, an• said can 
yoit find somebod' in Cali-
forpla to pay the expenses. 
Thi " price tag b Walters 
wat-$10,000. I sai I could, 
and' I did. I then ent over 
to the Committee ti Re-elect 
at Magruder's invi ation and 
picked up an enve ope from 
Slcirdn. 

-.A "...t 'assume it was cash, be-
cage the envel pe was 
quite thick, but I d dn't look 
inside.: I gave it o a guy 
who Oorked for e (I was 
still with the Repu i lican Na-
tional Committee at the 
time) and he car ied it to 
California acid g ve it to 
somebody who d stributed 
it," Nofziger said. 

Nofziger refused to name 
the California inte mecliary, 
but the man was dentified 
independently as Jack B. 
Lindsay, a Los An eles food 
wholesaler and a tive Re-
publican who once served in 
the Reagan admi 'stration 
and was close friends with 
Nofziger. . 

Both Linds 	,ho is, head 
of California :Pods, Inc., 
and Walters, approached on 
the same subject eight 
months ago by The Wash-
ington Post, flatly denied 
any involvement with the 
national Nixon campaign. 
Walters acknowledged he 
ran an AIP re-registration 
drive, but said he had raised 
the 'money—which he Ott-
mated at $9,000—from inde- 

• pendent sources, including 
Willis Carto,' head of the 
right-wing Liberty Lobby. 

Walters, wIlb heads an 
agency called -American..Ad-
-vertising and Sales, again 
denied in a telephone inter-
view today any connection 
with CRP or any of its offi-
cials, and said Nofziger's 
statement was "a lie." 

But details of the re-regis-
tration plan, including the 
involvement of American 
Nazi canvassers, were out-
lined by a former aide to.  
Walters, Glenn Parker, dur-
ing The 'Washington Post's 
initial , investigation last Oc-
tober. 

Parker, a Nazi sympa-
thizer who broke with Wal- 

- hers, met with John Mitchell,: 
Magruder and 'a 'group off` 
unidentified aides in the 
Los Angeles Hilton in late 
October, 1,971, to discuss the 
re-registration plan. 

"Mitchell started the con-
versation," said Parker. "He 
said he had heard there was 
a way to remove the AIP 
from the ballot. He said 
they had run a poll between 
Muskie, Nixon and Wallace 
that showed that without 
Wallace, 4/5ths of the Wal-
lace vote would go to Nixon. 
He emphasized that •they 
thought they were in trou-
ble, and that Nixon espe-
cially wanted toytfin Califor-
nia." 

The re-registering plan  

was based on a provision of 
California law that requires 
a political party's registra-
tion to exceed one-fifteenth 
of total state registration to 
qualify for the ballot. With 
a deadline of Jan. 1, 1972, it 
would be necessary to con-
vert all but 10,000 of the 
140,000 registered AIP "vot-
ers—an enormous task. 

(Actually, even if that had 
been accomplished, Califor-
nia' law automatically quali-
fies a party for the ballot if 
it received more than 2 per 
cent of the vote in the previ-
ous gubernatorial election—
which AIP had done. Thus, 
the re-registration effort 
was doomed at the start—
why this was not known or 
taken into account during 
the planning is still not 
known.) 

It was revealed in March 
of this year that even after 
Wallace was shot in May, ' 
1972,,: top-level Republicans 

—were attempting to blopk 
third-party movement in his 
behalf. 

Two draft-Wallace work-
ers—Tom Turnipseed and 
Peter Beter—told the Wash-
ington Post that in a Ally, 
1972, meeting in the May-
flower Hotel, Mitchell and 
Harry S. Dent, then special 
counsel to the President, 
tried to enlist them to block 
a Wallace candidacy. 	-- 

beter, a wealthy business-
man and Wallace contribu-
ter who sought the Republi-
can gubernatorial nomina-
tion for governor in West 
Virginia in 1968, said the 
gist of the pitch was donq 
you know that this third-
party draft movement could 
hurt Mr. Nixon?" 

Beter said Dent offered 
Turnipseed, a South Caro-
lina lawyer and close Wal-
lace associate, a job "four, 
five, six times" and each  

ilin 	
. , 
ered him more 

moil 
Earlier in the year, ac-

cording to another source 
G. Gordon Liddy was corn- -
piling dossiers on third 
party candidates as part Of 
an attmept to challenge 
Wallace's place on the ballot 
in several states. 

Given the go-ahead from • 
Mitchell and Magruder, Par-
ker said he and Walters met 
the following day with Lind-
sey, who gave him the first 
of several payments total-
ing $10,000. The first pay-
ment was $2.500 in $100 
bills, Parker said. 

Walters, who had broken 
with Wallace a year earlier 
and had had a running fac-
tional battle with other lead- 

ers 	
. . . 

 of AIP in California, - 
launched the registration 
drive, but soon ran into 
problems. He tried to use as 
recruiters conservative Re-
publicans, notably members 
of a right-wing Republican 
volunteer group, United Re-
publicans of California. Us-
ing the name Committee 
Against Forced Busing Cs a 
front, the plan was for vol-
unteer canvassers to visit 
AIP registrants throughout 
the state and convince them 
to change registration tem-
porarily to Democrat or Re-
publican so they could vote 
against candidates in the 
primary who favored forced 
busing. 

en, the pitch went, vot-
ers uld re-register as AIP 
or vote for Wallace anyway 
in the general election. In 
effect, however, the gaol 
was to wipe AIP off the bal-
lot so that Wallace would 
have no party listing at elec-
tion time. 

But word got out, not only 
to AIP leaders, but to con-
servative UROC members, 
that the scheme was a dis-
guised effort on behalf of 
Mr. Nixon, who had become 
anathema to right-wing Re-
publicans because of his 
overtures to Red China. 
They denounced the scheme 
and refused to cooperate. 

It was then, around mid-
November, according to Par-
ker. that he and Walters 
turned to the American 
Nazis for help. 

Parker said he and Wal-
ters met with Joseph Tom-
masi in mid-November, 1971, 
and offered him $5,000 if he 

By Leroy F. Aarons• 
Washington Post Staff Writer 

LOS ANGELES, June 6— 
The 'Committee for the Re-
election of the President 
spent $10,000 in campaign 
money in an elaborate plan 
to deter a possible third-
party presidential drive in 
California by George Wal-
lace in 1971. 

The scheme failed, but not 
before the local California 
operatives allegedly hired.  a 
team of American Nazis. to 
convince American • Inde-
pendent Party voters to 
change their registr ion. If 
enough people e : ,A1; :the 
operatives figured,';; Wallace 
could be knocked ff the 



  

would use some Of his storm 
troopers as registrars. Toro-
masi, 22, a lieutenant who 
runs the Southern Califor-
nia branah of the Nazi Party 
out of a swastika-decorated 
frame house in El Monte, a 
suburb of Los Angeles, con-
firmed the offer. He said 
that a group of about 20 of 
his men, dressed neatly in 
civilian clothes, fanned out 
in the area, carrying regis-
tration lists denoting AIP-
member homes. 

The Nazis' involvement 
was cut short after a few 
weeks, however, when the 
money was stopped after 
only $1,200 had been deliv-
ered, Tommasi said. 

There was no evidence 
that the use of Nazis was 
known at high levels of the 
CRP operation in Washing-
ton. 

The registration drive was 
a dismal failure. California 
AIP registration actually in-
creased by 6,500 voters over 
the period that Walters and 
his group were trying to 
wipe it out. 

Walters denied that he 
had hired the Nazis, even 
when shown photostat cop-
ies of checks made out to 
Tommasirwith Walters' sig-
nature. Walters Said he of-
ten had given Parker blank 
signed checks to fill out for 
expenses. 

Walters also denied deal-
ing with Lindsey—the al-
leged go-between—but ad-
mitted he "may have" asked 
Lindsey by phone to contri-
bute to the re-registration 
effort. He said Lindsey turn-
ed him down. 

Lindsey, who was unavail- 

able today, said in October 
he ' had business dealings 

' with Walters involving a 
trucki g subsidiary Walters 
owned, but denied ever re- 
ceiving or passing money 
along to Walters. 

Nofziger said today he re-
ceived "two, possibly three" 
handwriten reports on the 
re-registration drive from 
his unidentified California 
connection, and had passed 
them long without reading 
them to Magruder. 

"I was involved only in a 
peripheral way", he said. . 

Nofziger said he heard 
from , Walters twice; once 
durin the spring of 1972, 
when Walters offered to 
campaign for Nixon . votes 
among Wallace-type voters: 
The second time was last *,--"=- 
October, Nofziger said, when 
Walters phoned to say "the 
lid was about to blow off" 
and insisted on talking to 
Nofziger. 

Nofziger said he assumed 
Walters was talking about 
newspaper investigations in-
to the re-registration drive; 
but he refused to take the 
calls because he did not 
want the California CRP 
office involved in any way 
with the Walters operation. 

One `source who asked not 
to be identified said. he as-
sumed 1 the money was fil-
tered through an intermedi-
ary because the national 
CRP *anted to "stay away 
from this." He said the com-
mittee I probably did not 
want to arouse the antago-
nism df the AIP at a time,  
when Wallace was still-  seri-
ously a candidate. 
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