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Nixon Medic Tells Burglary 
LONG BEACH — (AP) -

A former personal physician 
to P''resident Nixon says Nix-
onle;medical records • were 
taken from a safe in his of-
fice' and "obviously scruti-
nized" during the 1972 presi-
dential campaign. 

Dr. John Lungren, accord-
ing to the copyright story in 
the Long Beach Independ-
ent, Press Telegram today, 
said his office was burglar 
ized twice last September 
and the Nixon records were 
taken from a safe and scat-
tered on the floor. 

Lungren, a heart special-
ist and internist, said he last  

examined Nixon in 1969 and 
is now a "medical consult-
ant" to the President.. 

Police who investigated 
said $27 was taken in the 
first burglary. Lungren said 
the unlocked safe in which 
he kept the Nixon records 
had been ransacked but the 
records apparently were not 
disturbed the first time. 

In the second burglary, 
Lungren said. the Nixon 
medical records were ob-
viously disturbed although 
nothing e I s e, including 
money plainly visible, was 
taken. 	• 

"I don't believe that any  

of the records are missing, 
but the papers were out of 
chronological order and ob-
viously scrutinized," Lun-
gren was quoted as saying. 
"There is the supposition 
that they might have been 
photpgraphed." 

Lungren said he notified 
the White House of the bur-
glaries. 

"A number of FBI agents 
came to the office and I be-
lieve there was a combined 
investigation by the FBI and 
the local police," he added. 

"I have no idea of 'what 
value t h e Nixon records 
could be to anyone. 


