
Student If ERusp7enicieil 
Over Watergate Role 

NYpTm Utah, Feb. 6—
Thomas J. Gregory, one of 
the Government's chief wit-
nesses in the Watergate trial, 
was suspended as a Brigham 
Young University student to-
day for his activities as a 
political spy. 

Mr. Gregory, a senior at 
the university, testified about 
his role during the trial of 
the seven men accused of 
bugging the Democratic Na-
tional Headquarters last 
June. 

A university announce-
ment said htat Mr. Gregory 
would be barred for at least' 
two semesters because 'his 
"undercover activities, while 
ostensibly working for Presi-
dential candidates, were in 
violation of the B.Y.U. code 
of honor, which requires that 
students must be 'honest in 
all behavior.' 

Mr. Gregory had con-
ducted his espionage while 
on an ,off-campus study proj-
ect in political science. The 
announcement said that he 
had been givn a ailing grade 
and would receive no credit 
for the project. 


