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Washington 
Los Angeles lawyer Don-

ald H. Segretti has been 
subpoenaed by a Senate 
subcommittee to testify 
about alleged attempts to 
spy on the Democratic 
presidential candidates, it 
was learned yesterday. 

Senate sources said that 
Segretti was subpoenaed to 
appear before the judiciary 
subcommittee on adminis-
trative practice and proce-
dure headed by Senator Ed-
ward M. Kennedy (Dem-
Mass.). 

The sources indicated that 
Segretti would be called to 
appear for questioning be-
hind closed doors some time 
before the end of the year. 

The subpoena was issued 
to Segretti at his Los Ange-
les county apartment i n 
Marina del Rey. 

According to published re-
ports, Segretti allegedly was 
involved in a White House-
directed spying and sabo-
tage operation against Dem-
cratic candidates through-
out the 1972 presidential 
campaign. 
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