
have implied President Nixon,  
is barbaric_in4is conduct of 
the war and -you have .repeat-
edly used personal attacks;, in 
your campaign against the 
President. How-  do you recon-
cile this with your views that 
issues should be rationally dis-
cussed and that harsh rhetotic 
is counterproductive? There is 
a good amount of public opin-
ion that you have used some 
of the most strident language 
of any presidential campaign 
ever." 

McGovern, looking sur-
prised to be answering White 
House questionS, denied ever 
calling Nixon an Adolf Hit-
ler. He said he had stated that 
bombing civilian populatiOns 
in Indochina "is the most bar-
baric thing. that hfis been done 
by any great power since the 
Nazis were in office, and I per-
sonally hold Mr. Nixon respon-
sible for that." 

Reynolds said he 
learned about the White 
House questions yesterday 
morning when he. came to the 
Washington studio to prepare 
for the McGovern interview. 

',There were five or six ques-
tions 'sent over with the Gen-
nally transcript," he said. "I 
asked the one about campaign 
rhetoric simply because I 
thought it was the most inter-
esting." 

.Reynolds said none of the 
other questions dealt with the • 
Watergate allegations. 

Bocci Fisch, a production as-
sistant for the program, said 
the questions were sent to 
ABC Saturday by Al Snyder, a 
staff aide to Herbert G. Klein, 
White House Communications 
director. 

"He 'called to see if we got 
the (Connally) transcript and 
then said he was 'sending 
along' a few questions' to ask 
McGovern on the show," Fisch 

Snyder could not 'be reached 
for a comment yesterday.. A 
White .1House operator said 
"everyone in Mr. Klein's office 
has wine to the ball game.", 

"I think this is really an in-
teresting development here, 
that I should come on a pro-
gram ' to' be interviewed and 
have questions submitted by 
the White House," McGovern 
said during the program. 

"Isn't it interesting that the 
President himself is afraid, ap- 
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Tile White House had some 
questions for Sen. George 

. McGovern yesterday, but it 
wailed a television reporter 
to itthem. „ 	. 

"They are question's from 
• the White House," said ABC 

special correspondent Frank 
Reynolds during' McGovern's 
a,ppiaranee on that-network's 
"Isines and Answers" pro- 
 . 	.. 

• gram. "I will, read one it, you 
don't mind."-  - • - '  

Reynolds told ',the Demo-
cratic presidential candidate 
that Ote qu'estiOns, "phrased in 

. question-type language," had 
been sent over after ABC 
called the White House to re-
quest a transcript of former 
Treasury Secretary John Con-
nally's "Democrats for Nixon" 
telev sion address. i  
, "I wish we had thoi-Preik 

dent he r.:0,404 coidd4-sk hid] 
som 'questions, but I Wilitake 
his,' ' said McGovern,. wi-io has 
repeatedly Challenged Presi-
den Nixon to a debate before 
the ov. 7 election. 

ter answering one White 
rHou e question about cam 
,pal' rhetoric, McGovern said 

d a question of his own: 
n-1,  by have we had no ex- 

plan
ti 

tion from the President 
of e United States about his 
seyen agents campaigning for 
his Ire-election who invaded 
the Democratic National Oom-
mittee?" 

MGovern then launched eib  
into an attack on the Water-
gate ugging incident and sub-
sequent allegations of acts of 
political sabotage and espio-
nageorchestrated by White 
Houand re-election cornmit-
tee a des. es.  

`I ant to know, Mr Nixon, 
'why you permitted activities 
of that kind to take place in 
this country?" asked Mc-
Govern. "Why were you will-
ing - co do something unprece-
dented in American politics in 
order to retain your control of 
the White Houst?" 

The question about rhetoric 
was the only White House , 
que on Reynolds used on the I 
air. I

4 
read: 

"You have likened President 
Nixon. to Adolf Hitler. You ..... 

parently; to come on, this pro- i 
gram with me; or to. come on 
any other television program 
and raise his own questions... 
he knows that I would have 
some questions for him," Mc-
Govern said. 

The Democratic presidential 
candidate complained that the 
public was using a double 
standard in assessing Nixon's 
involvement with the. Water-
gate bugging. 

"If seven of my top assist-
ants had been caught burglar-
izing the Republican Natonal 
Committee and had been in-
dicted by a grand jury, I know 
that I would have been held 
responsible for that" ' Mc-
Govern said. 

"1 might just as we,,11 have 
dropped out of the r4be if it 
had happened an the Demo-
cratic side . . . but some peo-
ple but Mr. Nixon above the 
battle," he said. 

another television i1iter 
view yesterday, McGoVern's 
running mate, Sargent Shriver, 
said Nixon "should come clean 
as 	hound's tooth" on the 
Watergate affair. 	' 

Sin iver, appearing orC-  the 
CBS program, "Face the Na-
tion," said the phrase was the 
same pne used by former Pres-
idenrDwight D. Eisenhower in 
1952 %when the' public was'out-
raged by a mere $18,000" 
Nixon was accused of having 
in a secret "slush fund." 

"I don't think the moral con-
science of the American peo- 
ple has degenerated so much 
since . . . so that the Presi-
dent can be,.the only candidate.  

I to refuse tedisclose where his 
!campaign money comes from." 


