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No exploration of motives, no revelation of spy funds. 

Back in June, when Lavelle had tes-
tified before a House committee, he im-
plied that Abrams had known about his 
activities and, worse, had perhaps sanc-
tioned them. But last week, under pin-
point questioning by Senate committee 
members, Lavelle admitted that he not 
only had never requested Abrams' au-
thorization, but had never even told his 
superior his theory that the new radar 
setup called for a more liberal interpre-
tation of the rules. That admission 
seemed to clear the way for Abrams' 
confirmation as Army Chief of Staff, 
but by no means answered all the ques-
tions of who else was involved in La-
velle's secret raids. 
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Seven Down 
on Watergate 

After laboring for three months, 
the Justice Department last week ob-
tained the long-expected indictments in 
the Watergate bugging case--and an-
nounced that the investigation was 
"over, for all intents and purposes." The 
indictments, which did not involve John 
Mitchell, Robert Mardian or any high-
level personnel of the Committee for 
the Re-Election of the President, failed 
to explain the motives for the political 
espionage at the Democratic National 
Committee headquarters, or who on the 
President's committee authorized the 
secret funding of the spy project. 

The five men arrested in the-  Wa-
tergate on June 17—James W. McCord, 
Bernard L. Barker, Eugenio R. Marti-
nez, Frank A. Sturgis and Virgilio R. 
Gonzalez—were all charged with con-
spiring to break into the Democratic of-
fices in order to plant bugs, tap tele-
phones and intercept conversations. 
Also charged were G. Gordon Liddy, a 
onetime White House aide and former 
counsel to the Re-Election Committee's 
finance division, and E. Howard Hunt, 
a former White House consultant. The 
violations carry penalties of up to 34 
years in prison and $80,000 in fines. 

Not indicted was a man who, TIME 
has learned, monitored and transcribed 
many of the Democrats' conversations 
from a Howard Johnson motel room 
across the street from the Watergate. 
He is Alfred Carleton Baldwin, a for-
mer FBI agent who served as a body- 

r. guard for. John Mitchell and his wife 
Martha when the former Attorney Gen-
eral headed the Re-Election Committee. 

; Baldwin has explained his role in the 
'Watergate affair to both the Justice De-
partment and attorneys for the Dem- 

. ocratic National Committee, and is ex-
pected to be the Government's key 
witness in theimpending cases. 
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Baldwin had complained of bore-
dom in guarding the Mitchells and was 
assigned by McCord, chief security co-
ordinator for the Re-Election Commit-
tee, to monitor the bugs.For three 
weeks in May and June he typed the 
conversations and gave them to Mc-
Cord, who converted them into memos 
that went, Baldwin contends, to the Re-
'Election Committee. Baldwin's own in-
volvement became known because he 
had found the bugging, too, a bit bor-
ing, and for diversion had placed a call 
from the motel room to his home in 
West Haven, Conn. The motel kept a 
record of the call. 

The grand jury investigation also 
did not go into allegations of mishan-
dled campaign funds, a charge brought 
against the C.R.P. by the General Ac-
counting Office. The Justice Depart-
ment has not yet even asked the FBI to 
investigate those accusations. With the 
Democrats' civil suit against the Re-
Election Committee now apparently 
stalled in the courts, Democrats in Con-
gress are taking up the challenge, in 
hopes of learning more before the elec-
tion. Last week the House Banking and 
Currency Committee, headed by Texas 
Democrat Wright Patman, issued a re-
port detailing the movement of $100,-
000 in Nixon campaign contributions 
through Mexico and contending that 
some of it was used in the bugging plot. 

The Patman committee report 
states that Maurice Stans, the C.R.P. na-
tional finance chairman and former 
Secretary of Commerce, knew about the 
Mexican transactions. Stans discussed 
the case with investigators for Patman's 
committee and at first denied any such 
knowledge. Pressed by Patman, howev-
er, he conceded that he had received a 
call from Texas about the $100,000. 
TIME has learned that just before talk-
ing to the Patman staff, Stans received 
a call from President Nixon in San Cle-
mente. It was described by White House 
Press Secretary Ron Ziegler as a "keep-
your-spirits-up type call." Stans has re- 

sisted a formal committee hearing, how-
ever, and Democrats hope to subpoena 
him. Last week Stans filed a $5,000,000 
libel suit against the former National 
Democratic Committee Chairman Lar-
ry O'Brien, for "falsely and maliciously 
accusing" him of "a number of crim-
inal acts." Stans also filed a $2.5- mil-
lion suit against O'Brien and his attor-
neys for using the courts "to create 
headlines for partisan ends." O'Brien 
has attempted to add Stans as a defen-
dant in the $1,000,000 violation-of-
civil-rights suit that he has filed against 
the Watergate Five. Considering the 
slowness of the courts and the confus-
ing nature of all the litigation, it seems 
likely that the Watergate battle will now 
shift to Capitol Hill. 

VORGIN ISLANDS 

rehind the Facade 
Tropical squalls of racial tension 

have twisted through the islands of the 
Caribbean with increasing frequency in 
recent years. But the wanton shooting 
of eight people, including four tourists 
from Florida, at a golf club earlier this 
month on St. Croix, largest of the three 
American Virgin Islands, seemed to 
portend something deeper. To assess 
the mood, TIME Correspondent Peter 
Range visited St. Thomas and St. Croix 
last week and sent this report: 

THE license plates advertise AMERI-
I CAN PARADISE—VIRGIN ISLANDS. 

And so they still seem to be. Gleaming 
white cruise ships dock at Long Bay on 
St. Thomas, their passengers pouring 
forth to fresh feasts like ants toward a 
sugar cake. Taxis whisk tourists to the 
duty-free shopping district to ring up 
discount deals on Arpege, Nikons and 
Johnny Walker Red. En route they pass 
black schoolchildren in burgundy tar-
tan jumpers and stiff white shirts who 
are shouting and skipping happily home 
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