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Anti-War Cases 

U.S. Ordered to 
Reveal . Wiretaps 

Washington 
U.S. District Judge Au-

brey E. Robinson Jr. ruled 
yesterday that the federal 
government must disclose 
the nature and extent of 
wire taps and electronic sur-
veillance on several anti-
war leaders and groups. 

The government had con-
tended that it was not com.  

gelled to disclose such infor-
mation on "national securi-
ty". grounds. 

Although such orders are 
not unusual in criminal 
cases, Robinson's decision 
marks the first time that the 
government has been or-
dered to disclose such wire-
tap information in connec-
tion with a civil suit, accord-
ing to an attorney :familiar 
with wiretap cases. 

The order cannot be ap-
pealed, but the government 
could file a motion asidng 
the judge to reconsider his 
order or asking that the in-
formation be placed under 
seal once it is given to the 
plaintiff, according to the at-
torney. 

Leon Friedman, an Ameri-
can Civil Liberties Union at-
torney in New York, termed 
the order a "significant vic-
tory" in disclosure of Wire-
t a p information. Govern-
ment attorneys could not be 
reached for comment. 

The ruling came in a suit 
filed 41/2 years ago by eight 
persons charged with at-
tempting to disrupt the 1968 
Democratic National Con-
vention in Chicago and nine 
groups active in the, anti-war 
movement. The suit was de- 
1 a yed 	-While criminal 
charges against the eight 
were being litigated. 

The government had sub-
mitted a 43-page brief in de-
fense of its refusal to answer 
interrogatories in the suit, 
which are written questions 
submitted by the plaintiffs. 

Those • interrogatories -
which the government must 

• now answer within 30 days 
— ask for detailed informa-
tion as to which plaintiffs 
were tapped, when they 
ytrere, -,14ppec act--hM—ig the 
taps remained, who author-
ized the taps, and the reason 
such taps, were deemed nec-
essary.' 
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