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MAR 	2 4 azz, U.S.-BONN TALK HEW 
ON 2 RADIO STATIONS 

BONN, March 23 (AP) -
Chancellor Willy Brandt's Gov- 
ernment said today that it was 
conferring with Washington on 
the future of Radio Free Europe 
and Radio Liberty. 

The Government spokesman, 
Conrad Ahlers, said Bonn re- 
cognized the significance of the 
United States-financed stations 
in providing information to 
people in the Soviet bloc but 
wanted to avoid possible harm 
to West German foreign rela-
tions. 

He was commenting, on a call 
for closing the stations made 
in messages to President Nixon 
and Chancellor Brandt by seven 
Social Democrats. 

The United States House of 
Representatives has voted funds 
for the stations, which are in 
Munich, through June 30. The 
bill has been sent to the Senate, 
where Senator J. W. Fuibright, 
chairman of the Foreign Rela-
tions Committee, has been lead- 
ing a campaign against what 
he terms "relics of the cold 
war." 

The messages called on Mr. 
Nixon to halt the financing of 
the stations and to make their'  
frequencies available to the 
Cologne-based Deutsche Welle 
station, which they said could 
provide "realistic reportage" to 
the Soviet bloc. 


