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KISSINGER DISCUSSES 
TRIP WITH BUCKLEY 

Special to The New York Times 

WASHINGTON, March 7— 
After an hour with Henry A. 
Kissinger, President Nixon's as-
sistant for national security, 
Senator James L. Buckley said 
today that he was still con-
cerned about the effects of Mr. 

Nixon's trip to China on allies 
in Asia. 

The New York Conservative-
Republican said that the meet-
ing had satisfied him that the 
United States did not intend to 
repudiate its commitments to 
aid Asian nations, including the 
Republic of China on Taiwan. 
But he said he was still con-
cerned about interpretations 
abroad of the results of the trip 
and he reiterated that Mr. Nix-
on should affirm that the Unit-
ed States "was not backing 
away from its commitments." 

Mr. Buckley, who last week 
characterized the trip as "a dis-
astrous adventure in American 
diplomacy," said that his meet-
ing with Mr. Kissinger, ar-
ranged at Mr. Kissinger's re-
quest, made him "better aware 
of some of the problems" en-
countered by the Presidential 
party in China. 

"But this does not affect my 
concern about the net results 
of the China excursion," he 
added, or the need to reassure 
the Asians "who need reas-
suring." 


