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By PAUL DELANEY JAN 4 1971 
Special to The New York Times 

WASHINGTON, Jan. 3—The Nixon Administration plans 
a series of moves to placate several top Negro officials who 
're, distressed over the Administration's civil rights policies 

and are threatening to resign. 
At least two blaCk officials 
have indicated that they plan 

I 

to quit their posts shortly, 
while several others have set 
an informal deadline of June 
for the Administration to 
make some positive changes. 

The White House is dis-
tressed that such an effort 
might snowball end result in 
the loss of all senior Negro 
officials, according to a high 
Administration official. To 
.counter this threat, he said, 
the Administration will take 
action to hold Negro officials 
already in the Administration, 
to attract more to high posi-
tions and to appeal to black 
voters in 1972. 

Problem of Prevention 
Steps under consideration in-

clude a major policy statement, 
possibly in the State of the 
Union message later this 
month, the naming of blacks to 
key White House positions and 
improvement and stronger en-
forcement of programs aimed 
at blacks and other minorities, 
such as the Philadelphia Plan 
and minority capitalism. 

"But the immediate problem 
is to prevent any of the blacks 
already here from leaving, or 
we won't be able to attract 
anybody," the official com-
mented. 

The black officials who said 
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they planned to leave insisted 
on anonymity at this time. 
They said they were "looking 
for some kind of moral leader-
ship, a positive statement, a 
good, strong speech from the 
White House to take some of 
the heat off us in the black 
community." 

Blacks appointed by Mr. Nix-
on met with him last March 
and implored him to take 
stronger action in civil rights 
matters. They have been 14dis-
appointed in the action he has 
taken since then, several said. 

"If the Administration does 
not move by the beginning of 
summer to improve its image, 
I don't see how I can remain 
on board," one black official 
remarked. 

"If nothing is done by then, 
it definitely will be too late 
for us to try and be effective 
in the coming election-year 
campaign. If things don't im-
prove, we won't have anything 
at all to sell to the black com-
munity," he said. 

Too Little, Too Late' 
One of the Negroes who said 

he would definitely leave felt 
that it was too late for the 
Administration to attempt a 
major change to attract blacks, 
that any more would be "too 
little, too late." He said, "many 
of the people around Mr. Nixon 
just have no understanding of 
or sensitivity to the problems 
of blacks." 

Another official cited an ex-
ample. He said a Negro official 
and his white superior were 
speaking before separate black 
audiences at a black meeting. 
Afterwards, the black official 
went to the hotel room of his 
,superior, who immediately 
chastised the black for not be-
ing at the same session to take 
some of the heat. 

"But I was catching hell at 
the other meeting," the black 
official explained. 

"Yes, but that's what we pay 
you to do," his boss shot back. 

The Administration official 
said he was concerned about a 
snowball effect in case one or 
two blacks resigned. 

One black official acknowl-
edged that the resignation last 
month of James Farmer as 
Assistant Secretary of Health, 
Education and Welfare had an 
effect on him, adding, "If other 
guys go, I certainly am not 
going to sit around and be the 
last one to leave." 

Mr. Nixon has appointed 
blacks to Assistant and Deputy 
Assistant Secretary posts in 
several departments, as well as 
to head several smaller units. 
Posts occupied by Negroes in-
clude those of Assistant Secre-
tary of Labor and two Assistant 
Secretaries of the Department 
of Housing and Urban Develop-
ment and two Deputy Assistant 
Secretaries of Defense. 

Fletcher Expects Change 
Arthur Fletcher, Assistant 

Secretary of Labor, was the 
only Negro official willing to 
be quoted by name. He con-
firmed that many Negro of-
ficials were uneasy over Ad-
ministration policy. He said he 
was optimistic there will be 
substantial and substantive 
change over the next few 
months, but he said the situa-
tion right now was critical be-
cause the black leaders and the 
community expected change. 

"And black officials look for 
immediate accelerated move-
ment by the Administration," 
he added. "This has got to be 
part of the President's game 
plan. Blacks would like for the 
President to be on the offen-
sive early in the third quarter 
in order to have a good fourth 
quarter. We are entering the 
third quarter." 

Mr. Fletcher said the black 
officials would remain as long 
as they had the feeling they 
were accomplishing something 
providing them with the man-
power, money and machinery 
to do an effective job. 

"The bulk of black officials 
feel that, in spite .of the less 
than admirable public image of 
the. Administration in the black 
community, they are getting 
things done by being inside,"  
the Assistant Secretary con-
tinued. 

'They have said to me pri-
vately that if it appears they 
were not getting anywhere they 
would quit. They have no hesi-
tation about seeking opportuni-
ties outside Government. Some 
already have• offers that are 
good," Mr. Fletcher said. 

Explaining the administra-
tion's image problems in the 
black community, one official 
said: 

"We had the problem of try- 

ing to get through 'to a com-
munity that passionately digs-
trusted us in the first place, 
and this was compounded by 
a so-called southern strategy. 
Blacks felt that if we gave 
them something good with the 
right hand, we took it away 
with the left hand. 

"For example, a good pro-
gram such as the Philadelphia 
Plan was negated by the nomi-
nation of a Harrold Carswell 
to to Supreme Court." 

Another criticism of the Ad-
ministration by blaCks was that 
there was no exposure to the 
black community. For example, 
the professional staffs of Com-
munications Director Herbert 
G. Klein and Press Secretary 
Ronald L. Ziegler are all white. 

Also, President Nixon has 
never appeared before a black 
audience, although he has re-
ceived the leaders of several 
Negro organizations at the 
White House. One White House 
staff member reported last Au-
gust that Mr. 'Nixon would visit 
black college campuses, but 
that trip never materialized. 


