
Coalition Government 
Urged at Lower Levels 
VIENTIANE, June 5 (AP) -

Laos' coalition Cabinet pro-
posed today that both the pro-
Communist Pathet Lao and 
the non-Communist faction of 
neutralists and rightists be 
represented in local govern-
ments throughout  the king-
dom, a government spokesman 
said. 

Details of the plan were not 
available, but it would appar-
ently give the non-Communist 
side of the coalition an official 
standing in the large part of 
the country that has been un-
der control of the Communist 
Pathet Lao for years. 

The Laotian Cabinet spokes-
man, Ouday Souvannouvong, 
said the proposal would be 
sent to Prince Souphanou-
vong, nominal head of the Pa-
thet Lao, which has gained all 
but complete dominance in 
Laos in the last month. 

Under the plan, Ouday said. 
a province with a Communist 
governor would have a non-1 
Communist deputy, and vice-1 
versa. 


