
Secretary of State Henry 
A. Kissinger said there will 
be a "substantial reduction" 
of the U.S. community in 
Laos because of the harass-
ment of Americans by leftist 
students. 

The developments came 
as three Americans, includ-
ing two U.S. Marine guards, 
remained prisoners in a U.S. 
compound in Vientiane and 
the Communist - dominated 
government decided to end a 
24-year'-old American a i d 
program. 

The United States evacu-
ated Americans from Cam-
bodia before it fell April 17 
and from South Vietnam be-
fore it surrendered to the 
Communists on April 30. But 
Kissinger told newsmen in 
Ankara. Turkey, that the de-
partures f r om Vientiane, 
starting today, are not con-
sidered a complete evacua-
tion "at this point." 

A U.S. Embassy spokes-
man in Vientiane, w h o 
called the departures an 
"accelerated withdrawal," 
said the Americans would 
leave by chartered Royal 
Air Lao jet,  and that "hun-
dreds of Americans would 
be flown out in the near fu-
ture." 

The Americans and for- 
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and children at the gates of 
the main housing compound 
before their departure. 
Americans with dogs, chil-
dren with bicycles and wom-
en in curlers stood at the 

.Chain-link fence looking out. 
About 400 Americans were 

confined to the main housing 
compound four miles south 
of Vientiane. Pathet Lao 
guards, armed with rocket 
launchers, searched every 
car that came out of the 
Florida-style suburb known 
as "Levittown on the Me-
kong," They seized cameras 
and other valuable items. 

With a major U.S. AID in-
stallation in Vientiane occu-
pied by. a sit-in student dem-
onstration and other. U.S. 
AID offices throughout the 
country wrecked and aban-
doned, U.S. officials were 
busy arranging flights for 
the women and children. 

The embassy spokesman 
said most of the first evac- 

although the U.S. Embassy 
claims the 1951 treaty that 
established the U.S. AID op-
eration in Laos contains a 
90-day termination clause. 

At a press briefing cover-
ing a Wednesday night cabi-
net meeting, a Laotian gov-
ernment spokesman said the 
government has decided. to 
ask for an end to all U.S. ac-
tivities in Laos and the hand-
over of all AID material in 
the country after an invento-
ry was taken. 

T h e spokesman, Ouday 
Souvannavong, deputy min-
ister of information, said, 
however, that the govern-
ment still wants economic 
assistance from the United 
States but that it must be di-
rect aid to the Laotian gov-
ernment, such as other 
countries are giving. 

He said the U.S. Embassy 
had agreed to close all U.S. 
AID branches in the prov-
inces, and a joint U.S.-Lao-
tian committee would be 
formed to negotiate an end  

uees would be AID employ-
ees and their dependants. 

Most of those scheduled to 
leave had their passports in 
safekeeping in one of the 
buildings of the AID com-
pound, which has been occu-
pied by student demonstra-
tors since Wednesday. 

One of the demands of stu-
dents occupying the sprawl-
ing U.S. AID compound in 
Vientiane, where the two 
Marines and an American 
civilian were held, is that 
Americans pay tax on all 
luxury items they have im-
ported duty-free, including 
kitchen utensils: 

However, a government 
spokesman said American 
U.S. AID employees have 
diplomatic privilege's a n d 
their property will be re-
spected. 

The students had demand-
ed that American AID per-
sonnel leave within three 
days. They now agree to a 
30-day withdrawal period, 

to the U.S. AID operation in 
Vientiane. 

Meanwhile, t h e Pathet 
Lao control of Laos ay-
peared to be almost com 
plete. 

The Pathet Lao now has 
troops in every major city, 
a n d the once powerful 
right-wing faction of the co-
alition government of left-
ists, rightists and neutralists 
appears to have been rout-
ed. 

There were more strikes 
by government officials 
showing their support for 
the government and opposi-
tion to right-wing and "reac-
tionary"' forces, most of 
whom-  fled the country two 
weeks ago. 

Workers at government-
owned Royal Air Lao staged 
t h e latest strike pasting 
posters at the airport and 
the airline's downtown office 
pledging support for the Pa-
thet Lao-dominated govern-
ment. 
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AID Program Ends 

18 American 
Prisoners in 
Laos Are Freed 

Vientiane 

Eighteen Americans, as well as a number of Brit7  
ons and other Europeans held by student demonstra- r 
tors in a southern Laotian town for nine days were • 
flown to Thailand yesterday. 

eigners in the southern town 
of Savahnakhet were flown 
to Thailand aboard a U.S': 
plane. Most of the Ameri-
cans were officials of the 
U.S. Agency for Internation-
al Development, a group op-
posed by student demonstra-
tors. 

Previously, the embassy 
said 12 Americans were 
being held in the town. It 
gave no reason for the 
change in figures, but com-
munications with Savannak-
het in the past week have 
been restricted to brief radio 
contacts. 

I n Vientiane, American 
doctors gave vaccination 
shots to American women 
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A woman was allowed to leave the U.S. housing compound near Vientiane, where 40 Americans are confined 


