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2 More Jurors Seated in Shaw Trial 
school teacher, and Charles With Oswald and others to as• NEW ORLEANS — (AP) 

— Two more jurors have 
been seated for the trial of 
Clay Shaw, charged with 
conspiring to murder Presi-
dent John F. Kennedy. Both 
survived rigorous question-
ing. 

The jurors have been 
asked whether they thought 
the Warren Commission was 
right in saying Lee Harvey 
Oswald shot Kennedy, work 
ing alone and for reasons un-
known. 

The only acceptable an-
swer to both state and de- 1  
fense was "I have no opin-
ion." 

Four jurors were seated in 
the first two days of what the 
prosecution predicts might 
be a two-month hearing. It 
resumed today with efforts 
continuing to pick a jury. 

The two chosen yesterday 
were William Ricks Jr., 31, a 

D. Ordes, 39, assembly line 
supervisor at a can manufac-
turing plant. 

District Attorney Jim Gar-
rison has rejected the War-
ren Commission conclusions, 
charging that Shaw, 55, a re-
tired businessman, conspired  

sassinate Kennedy. 
The defense issued new su-

penas including one for Mrs. 
Ruth Hyde Paine of Irving, 
Tex., who befriended Os-
wald's wife Marina during 
periods Oswald was out of 
work. 
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Shaw in S.F. 

The Day JEW 

Was Slain 
Clay Shaw, on trial in New 

Orleans on charges of con- 
spiracy to assassinate Presi-
dent Kennedy, was in San 
Francisco Nov. 22, 1963, the 
day of the assassination in 
Dallas. 

Shaw was then managing 
director of the International 
Trade Mart in New Orleans. 
He had a room reserved for 
him at the St. Francis Hotel 
from Nov. 21 through Nov. 
24. 	• 

He spent most of the morn-
ing of Nov. 22 at the World 
Trade Center here talking to 
local trade leaders. 

J. Monroe Sullivan. then 
executive director of the San 
Francisco World Trade Cen- 
ter, said he arranged a spe-
cial luncheon at the World 
Trade Club for Shaw but the 
news of the assassination 
was received and only 14 per-
sons attended. 

Don E. DeLone, trade pro-
motion manager for the Port 
of San Francisco. recalled 
Shaw as an "urbane" person. 

"He appeared just as 
shocked and depressed as we 
were over the tragedy in Dal-
las," DeLone said. 


