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Intimidation 
No Issue' in 
Kohn Case 

The indictment of Aaron M. 
Kohn, managing director of the 
Metropolitan New Orleans 
Crime Corn mission, in no way 
fell under the definition of pub-
lic intimidation, Criminal Dis-
trict Court Judge Edward A. 
Haggerty Jr., said yesterday. 

In written reasons for his ac-
liqn in quashing the indictment 
orKohn, Judge Haggerty said 
he failed to see "where there 
is any use of violence, force or 
threats" by Kohn against Coun-
cilman Eddie L. Sapir in a state-
ment by Kohn on Oct. 3. 

"At best it is a mere accu-
sation that he (Sapir) may or 
may not have companionship 
with certain members of the 
community," said the judge. 

Kohn, in the Oct, 3 state-
ment, questioned Sapir's- mo-
tives in deliberating on a pro-
posed charity bingo ordinance, 
and alleged a "rather continu-
ous and close" relationship be-
tween Sapir and Carlos Marcel-
la 

The defense alleged the in-
dictment ihould be thrown out 
because there was no allega-
tion of violence, force or 
threats. The state contended 
the statement quoted in the in-
dictment did contain threats. 

During World War II, the 
Declaration of Independence 
and the Constitution were 
wrapped in special acid-free 
paper, sealed in bronze con-
tainers Racked in rock wool 
box, an were taken to a 
three-yepr exile in the gold-
billion vaults at Ft. Knox, Ky. 


