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tempted interception of tele-
phone and other communica-
tion. 

All five suspects, well-
dressed, wearing rubber surgi-
cal gloves and armed only 
with tear gas pens, were ar-
rested about 2:30 a.m. Satur-
day by D.C. police inside the 
sixth floor 29-office suite of 
the Democratic headquarters 
in the Watergate, 2600 Vir-
ginia Ave. NW. 

Though the alleged bugging 
attempt at first appeared to be 
very sophisticated and profes-
sional, experts in the field of 
wiretapping have since said it 
was amateurish. 

Capt. Riarc:nz of 
the Nac y reserves acknowl-
edged that McCord was a 
member of the Office of Emer-
gency Preparedness special 
analysis division, a 15-member 
reserve unit that meets 
monthly at 604 17th St. NW, 
across from the Executive Of-
fice Building. 

Franz said he could not dis-
cuss the work of the unit. 
However, other sources in the 
unit said that one of its func-
tions is to develop a list of 
radicals and contingency plans 
for censorship of the news 
media and U.S mail in event 
of war. 

McCord dropped out of the 
unit about four months ago. 
He is a lieutenant colonel in 
the Air Force reserves. 

Meanwhile, the Interna-
tional Association of 
Police reported yesterday that 
they paid McCord about $750 
in March for teaching a five-
day course in security at an 
associaiton conference. 
Robert F. B ett, president 

of e pu 'c relations firm at 
which Hunt works, said yester-
day that the firm also has an 
affiliate, called Interpro res , 
that is attemptin 	crease 
American trade with Commu-
nist countries. 

Hunt worked for the 
White House a total of 63 
days in 1971 and another 24 
days so far this year, accord-
ing to White House spokesman 
Clawson. 

Hunt was brought into the 
White House by Colson be-
cause of his CIA expertise, 
Clawson said. He said Colson 
met Hunt in 1966 at the Brown 
University Club. 

Former Attorney General 
John N. Mitchell, head of the 
Nixon campaign committee, 
said in a prepared statement 
released Sunday, that the 
Presiden's committee is expe- 

riencing its own security prob-
lems. 

Pressed for elaboration on 
Republican security problems, 
DeVan L- Shu 	y, director 
of public relations for the 
committee, declined to give 
details yesterday. He said in-
vestigations are under way, 
but refused to disclose who 
was conducting them. 

Syumway said that one of 
the things that led the com-
mittee to suspect a deteriora-
tion of security was an Asso-
ciated Press tory last week 
that disclosed quotes from a 
closed-door meeting between 
Mitchell and a senior commit. 
tee staff member. 

`The story alleging that the 
Republicans were "targeting 
in" on Sen. McGovern, was 
not true, Shumway said.) 

Shumway said that as of 
yesterday morning, McCord 
was no longer on the commit-
tee payroll. 

In response to a reporter's 
question, Shumway said that 
McCord had been hired 
through the committee's per-
sonnel office, whose director is 
RobeA()1e. 

htuiriway said he would not 
make Odle available to a re-
porter "because he is not a 
public figure." Odle referred a 
reporter's questions to Shum-
way. 

Shumway said that McCord 
was dismissed by Odle be-
ause of the allegations stem-

ming from the "delicate situa-
tion." He said that it had been 
Odle's responsibility to make 
the original cheek of McCord's 
qualifications, and to make 
the decision, to hire. 

McCord had been working 
out of the committee's secu-
rity office on the third floor, 
Shumway said. "I assume he 
was in the office on a daily 
basis," he said. 

As security chief, McCord 
was responsible for setting up 
the committee's internal secu-
rity system and "would have 
the knowledge of whether we 
were under electronic surveil-
lance," Shummay said. 

Meanwhile, security precau-
tions at Republican committee 
headquarters have been tight-
ened as a result of the Water-
gate bugging attempt, Shum-
way said. He demurred when 
asked for details of the new 
precautions. 

"When you get into the area 
of political campaigns these 
days, you can't discuss such 
things (security) in depth," 
Shumway said. 

BUG, From Al 

Keijily„....Clawlen, current 
White House aide who until 
recently was a reporter, wrote 
in February, 1971, in The 
Washington Post that Colson 
had been "dubbed" as one of 
the "original back-room boys 
. . the brokers, the guys who 
fix things when they break 
down and do the dirty work 
when it's necessary." 

When Hunt was asked by a 
reporter yeateglaywhy two of 
the suspects had his phone 
number, he said, "Good God!" 
He then paused and said, "In 
view that the matter is under 
adjudication, I have no com-
ment." He then hung up the 
telephone. 

Clawson, now deputy direc-
tor of communications for the 
White House, said' yesterday 
that Hunt worked as a White 
House consultant in declassifi-
cation of the Pentagon papers 
and most recently on narcotics 
intelligence. 

He said Hunt last worked 
for the White House on March 
29, 1972, for a regular daily 
consultant fee. These fees are 
generally a $100 a day, other 
sources said. 

"I've looked into the matter 
very thoroughly and I am con-
vinced that neither Mr. Colson 
nor anyone else at the White 
House had any knowledge of, 
or participation in, this deplor-
able incident at the Demo-
cratic National Committee," 
Clawson said in a prepared 
statement. 

Hunt is employed as a 
writer with the public rela-
tions firm of Robert R. Mullen 
& Co.. 1790 Pennsylvania Ave. 
NW, directly across from both 
Mr. Nixon's re-election cam-
paign headquarters and the 
main White House offices. 
GET INSERT B 

This was the sequence of 
events when a Washington 
Post reporter called the White 
House and asked to speak to 
Howard E. Hunt early yester-
day: 

A switchboard operator 
rang an extension, and when 
no one answered, she told the 
reporter: "There is one other 
place he might be—in Mr. Col= 
son's office." She dialed Col-
son's office, where a secretary 
said, "Mr. Hunt is not here 
now." She then gave the re-
porter Hunt's number at the  

public relations firm across 
the street. 

Hunt's name and phone 
number was in the pop-up ad-
dress book of Eugenio Marti-
nez, a real estate agent and 
notary public who has been ac-
tive in the anti-Castro move-
ment in Miami. 

A small, black address book 
of one of the other suspects 
also has Hunt's name and 
phone number, the sources 
said. 

Also taken by police was a 
savings account book that 
shows Martinez has $7,199 in a 
Miami bank, according to the 
sources. 

Another name in one of the 
address books is that of James 
Grimm, head of housing for 
Ire—University of Miami. 
Grimm-yesterday told Post re-
porter Kirk Scharfenberg in 
Miami that Martinez contact-
ed him about two weeks ago, 
seeking housing for about 
3,000 Young ie 031b.o 'cans dur-
ing the Republican National 
Convention. 

Grimm said he could not 
provide the rooms because 
classes would soon begin. Re-
publican officials said they 
had no knowledge of Marti-
nez's efforts to secure housing 
for Young Republicans. 	. 

Martinez works in the real 
estate agency of another of 
the suspects, Bernard L. Bar-
ker, who is said by Cuban ex-
iles to have worked for the 
CIA since the Bay of Pigs in-
vasion in 1961. 

Baker is a joint investor in 
several apartment house de-
velopments in Miami with 

.A,51.rez, a Republi-
cano—  ran unsuccessfully 
for Dade County mayor in 
1970. 

In addition to Martinez and 
McCord, the other three sus-
pects, all Miami residents, 
have been identified as: Frank 
Sturgis, also known as Frank 
Fiorini, an American who 
served in Fidel Castro's revo-
lutionary army and has since 
been a leader in the anti-Cas-
tro guerrilla movement; Fir-
gilio R. Gonzales, a locksmith; 
and Bernard L. Barker, a na-. 
tive American said by exiles 
to have worked on and off for 
the CIA. 

McCord was still being held 
on $30,000 bond yesterday, and 
the other four on $50,000 bond. 

They are charged with at-
tempted burglary and at- 



Associated Press 

Democratic Chairman O'Brien says party may take court action on bugging attempt. 

Joseph A. Rafferty _Jr., a 
counsel Iror the five suspects, 
said last night that he would 
file a motion in D.C. Superior 
Court today seeking to reduce 

the bail of his clients. 
Rafferty said he is seeking 

to have the men released to 
the custody of a court-ap-
pointed "local person." The re-
duction, he said, would be in 
line with information about 
the suspects verified by bail 
bondsmen yesterday. 

In New York, where he was 
campaigning for today's pri-
mary, Sen. McGovern said 
that the incident "is the leg-
acy of years of wiretapping 
and snooping and invasion of 
privacy," in which the'govern-
ment has been involved. 

McGovern said he had no 

evidence that would link the 
Republican party or its lead-
ers to the weekend incident. 

Contributing to this story 

were Washington Post Staff 
Writers Kirk Scharfenberg, 
Ron Shaffer and Martin 
Weil. 




