
Judge Bars 

Voting List 
BALTIMORE (AP)—Balti- 

flore County election judges s
ave been barred by a federal 
ourt order from furnishing 
.sts of persons who vote 

Tuesday to representatives of 
he Committee For The Re-
ection of the President. 
Atty. Gen. Francis B. Burch 

said he would tell Anne Arundel 
and Howard county officials to 
abide by the order which dealt 
specifically with Baltimore 
County. 

The suit was filed by support-
ers of Sen. George S. 
McGovern. 

According to the suit, 
Reoublican election judges 
would have provided carbon 
copies of persons who voted to 
campaign officials. The Re-
publicans would compare the 
list of those who voted against 
lists of voters known to be fa-
vorable to President Nixon. 
Pro-Nixon voters who had not 
come to the polls would be con-
tacted and urged to turn out. 

Stephen Sachs, who argued 
the case Monday, said the prac-
tice violated equal protection 
guarantees since all election 
subdivisions were not able to 
provide such lists. 

Charles A. Pryor, the county 
election supervisor, said the 
proposed practice did not viol-
ate Gov. Marvin Mandel's 1970 
order agains election judges 
taking part in partisan political 
activities. 


