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How the Watergate Coverup Failed 
By Jack Anderson 

The astonishing story can 
now be told how the Water-
gate coverup suddenly tore 
apart at the stitches. 

Our sources declare categor-
ically that President Nixon 
had no advance knowledge of 
the Watergate break-in and 
bugging. From the first, for-
mer Attorney General John 
Mitchell and White House 
counsel John Dean also swore 
to him that they had no part 
in the illegal operation. It was 
well known around the White 
House, however, that Jeb 
Stuart Magruder was neck-
deep in the scandal. 

As No. 2 man on the cam-
paign committee, he directed 
the activities of Watergate 
ringleader G. Gordon Liddy. 

Liddy submitted regular re-
ports to Magruder on the bug-
ging operation under the code 
name, "Gemstone." Magruder 
also arranged for Liddy to 
draw cash out of, the commit-
tee's safe. 

After the arrest of the 
Watergate wiretappers, an agi-
tated Liddy immediately tried 
to contact Magruder in Cali-
fornia. Liddy demanded to use 
the White House security net-
work so he could speak on a 
secure phone. Unable to get 
through to Magruder's hotel, 
Liddy left a message for Ma-
gruder to call him- from a pay 
phone. 

When the call , came 
through, Liddy reported what 
had happened and received in-I  

structions to destroy all in-
criminating evidence. Finally, 
Magruder directed Liddy to 
report at once to Attorney 
General Richard Kleindienst. 

Liddy located Kleindienst at 
the Burning Tree golf course 
and rushed off to consult him. 
Powell Moore, the campaign 
press chief, asked to go along. 
They called Kleindienst into 
a back room and confided 
that the burglary-bugging 
squad, caught red-handed in-
side Democratic headquar-
ters, was headed by the Presi-
dent's campaign security chief. 

Coldly, Kleindienst picked 
up a telephone and reached 
Assistant Attorney General 
Henry Petersen. "Henry," in-
structed Kleindienst, "I want 
to be sure that these people 
are treated as any other per-
son would be treated who is 
arrested under those circum-

.stances." 
The chastened Liddy. re-

turned to campaign headquar-
ters and began stuffing his 
files into a small shredder, 
which chewed them up too 
slowly to suit him. So he hus-
tled upstairs with arms full of 
documents and ran them 
through a larger shredder. 

Over at the White House, 
meanwhile, Dean ordered two 
aides to clean out the files of 
Watergate conspirator E. How-
ard Hunt. Eight cardboard car-
tons of papers were sneaked 
out of the White House and 
stored in a warehouse. They 
were later returned to the 
White House, and most of the  

documents were selectively 
destroyed. 

Dean was ordered by the 
President to find out whether 
any White House people were 
involved in the Watergate 
crimes. Contrary to the im-
pression given out by the 
White House, Dean never 
submitted a written report. 

Our sources state flatly that 
Dean used his authority to ob-
struct the FBI and to keep in-
criminating evidence away 
from the Justice Department. 
He even ordered Hunt out of 
the country. White House aide 
Charles • •Colson, according to 
one source, exploded: "Do you 
want to make the Whte House 
an accessory to a fugitive 
from justice?" 

Cover-up Begins 
One of the President's clos-

est advisers, John Ehrlichman, 
wanted to put out a statement 
acknowledging 	Magruder's 
role in the Watergate conspir-
acy. This was vigorously op-
posed by Clark MacGregor 
who succeeded . Mitchell • as 
campaign chairman. 

A few presidential advisers, 
including Ehrlichman and Col-
son, warned the President in 
February that the Watergate 
decisions must have been ap-
proved by Mitchell and Dean. 
Mr. Nixon replied that both 
had denied any involvement 
and asked for proof. 

By mid-March, the Presi-
dent's faith in Dean began to 
waver. He ordered Dean to 
Camp David to write a belated  

report on his Watergate inves-
tigation. After a few days at 
the presidential retreat, Dean 
reported back to the President 
that he simply couldn't write a 
report. Angrily, Mr. Nixon 
took Dean off the Watergate 
case. 

Colson, meanwhile, took a 
lie-detector test to prove his 
own innocence. Dean was furi-
ous. "Now we're all going to 
have to take one,' he 
grumped. 

Colson and Ehrlichman also 
put together information that 
(1) Dean had advance know-
ledge of the Watergate bug-
ging; (2) Dean had ordered 
Hunt out of the country; and 
(3) Dean had authorized pay-
ments to the Watergate de-
fendants to keep their mouths 
shut. On Friday, April 13, 
Ehrlichman confronted Dean 
with the charges. 

That night, Dean put to-
gether some documents he 
had been saving, which indi-
cated both H.R. Haldeman and 
John Ehrlichman had knowl-
edge of the ,Watergate cov-
erup. Next day, Dean took the 
documents to Assistant U.S. 
Attorney Earl Silbert and 
made accusations against 
Haldeman, Ehlichnian, Mitch-
ell and Magruder. In return, 
Dean asked for immunity. 

Silbert refused to grant im-
munity. Instead, he called in 
Magruder and confronted him 
with Dean's revelations. This 
broke down Magruder who 
also confessed his role in the 
conspiracy. 
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