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House Majority Leader Richard 
K. Armey (R-Tex.) yesterday sug-
gested that the revenue loss from a 
repeal of the 1993 gasoline tax could 
be offset by cutting spending on edu-
cation. 

"Maybe we ought to take another 
look at the amount of money we are 
spending on education," Armey said 
on NBC's "Meet the Press." "There 
is a place where we're getting a de-
clining value for an increasing dollar. 
It's in education. 

"If in fact we can get some disci-
pline in the use of our education dol-
lar, I think we can make up the dif-
ference," Armey added. 

The White House said yesterday 
that targeting education funds is not 
acceptable. 

Reducing the federal 18.3-cents-
a-gallon gasoline tax by 4.3 cents, as 
proposed by Republicans, would 
save the average motorist about $27 
a year in taxes, but would reduce 
federal revenue by $30 billion to $35 
billion over the next seven years, the 
White House estimates. 

Senate Majority Leader and pre-
sumptive GOP presidential nominee 
Robert J. Dole (Kan.), who has made 
repeal of the 1993 gas tax a focus of 
his campaign against President Clin-
ton, plans to introduce legislation 
Tuesday to repeal the 1993 tax tem-
porarily. The increase was part of 
the deficit reduction package that 
Clinton pushed through Congress in  

1993 without a single Republican 
vote. 

Under the Dole proposal, the tax 
would be rolled back through Janu-
ary 1997 and a permanent repeal 
would be considered as part of the 
budget for the fiscal year starting 
Oct. 1. Clinton has said he would be 
willing to consider scrapping the tax 
if Republicans found a fair way to 
make up the revenue loss. 

But in a statement yesterday, 
White House Chief of Staff Leon E. 
Panetta called on Dole and House 
Speaker Newt Gingrich (R-Ga.) "im-
mediately and unequivocally" to re-
pudiate Armey's suggestion that ed-
ucation spending could be cut to 
finance a reduction in the gasoline 
tax. 

White House economic adviser 
Laura D'Andrea Tyson, also inter-
viewed on "Meet the Press," refused 
to say whether the president would 
sign a freestanding bill to kill the tax 
hike, but argued that any cut should 
be part of a balanced budget plan. 
"It's going to be very hard for them 
to find $30 billion to $35 billion," she 
said. 

Tyson stressed the White House 
would prefer tax deductions for edu-
cation or a family tax credit or an 
IRA expansion rather than a gaso-
line tax cut. 

Sen. Phil Gramm (R-Tex.), on 
ABC's "This Week With. David 
Brinkley," said the best way to offset 
the tax repeal would be to cut wel-
fare benefits for legal immigrants, 
which would result in savings of 
about $14 billion a year. He also said 
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