
GOP IsSplit 
On Raising 
Debt Ceiling 
Armey Seeks to Force 
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House Majority Leader Richard K. 
Armey (R-Tex.) said yesterday House 
Republicans would make no move to 
raise the limit on federal borrowing au-
thority without "substantial" budget 
concessions from President Clinton. 

Treasury Secretary Robert E. Rub-
in has found numerous ways to come 
up with cash to keep the government 
running, despite the hold-down on the 
government's ability to borrow. But 
Rubin has warned that he is running 
out of options and that without an in-
crease in the debt limit soon, the U.S. 
government could be forced into the 
first default in its history. 

Armey also said that if there is no 
budget deal by Friday, congressional 
Republicans are willing to extend for 
30 days the spending authority of the 
nine Cabinet departments and agen-
cies whose funds run out then—but 
only under strict conditions. 

On NBC's "Meet the Press," he said 
House Republicans would insist any 
extension of interim spending authori-
ty for the government be severely lim-
ited, allowing "the essential work of 
the government to go forward, but un-
der rigorous and demanding circum-
stances" intended to give Clinton "a 
greater incentive to get more serious 
about the budget." 

Armey's hard line on federal bor-
rowing authority was sharply different 
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from the approach of House Budget 
Committee Chairman John R. Kasich 
(R-Ohio) and reflected the division 
within GOP ranks on whether refusal 
to raise the debt limit with no strings 
attached is an effective strategy to 
force Clinton to make concessions on 
a balanced budget. 

Last week, Kasich said Republicans 
were ready to raise the $4.9 trillion 
limit on federal borrowing authority, 
'and suggested they would send Clin-
ton a bill to raise the debt limit that 
was "clean," or free of extraneous pro-
visions the White House might find 
objectionable. 

Armey, however, flatly dismissed 
that notion yesterday, saying Kasich's 
views were out of step with those of 
his GOP House colleagues. 

"You're not going to take it through 
the House, John Kasich's willingness 
to vote . . . to the contrary notwith-
standing," Armey said. A bill to raise 
the debt limit "is not coming through 
the House unless it carries with it 
something that is a substantial share 
of our agenda." 

Following Armey on "Meet the 
Press," White House Chief of Staff 
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action will be taken on the debt ceil-
ing," Lott said. But he added that 
'There may be some things on the 
debt ceiling other than just pure ex-
tension." 

Armey said that any bill to raise the 
debt limit should include a provision to 
"terminate the Commerce Depart-
ment" and contain legislative language 
that would "stop the treasury secre-
tary from . . . raiding the trust funds 
of federal workers." 

In November, Clinton vetoed a bill 
to increase the debt ceiling that includ-
ed such restrictions on the authority of 
the treasury secretary. "The presi-
dent's position is we have to have a 
clean extension of the debt ceiling," Pa-
netta said yesterday. "Let's not play 
games with the future of this country." 

Some House Republicans have 
threatened impeachment proceedings 
against Rubin to stop him from em-
ploying additional accounting maneu-
vers to carve out additional borrowing 
room for Treasury. Armey distanced 
himself from such sentiments yester-
day. "I don't know that anybody, for 
example, Judiciary Committee or the 
Ways and Means Committee, has got-
ten into the kind of research that 
would be necessary for any kind of se- 

rious talk on that front." But he ac-
cused Rubin of being "real tricky" in 
his use of the federal retirement 
funds. 

Armey's offer of another short-
term spending bill, or "continuing res-
olution," to avoid another partial fed-
eral shutdown Friday, drew a cautious 
response from administration officials. 

Panetta said only that Clinton 
would be willing to sign a measure 
similar to the one that has been in ef-
fect for the last several weeks. That 
bill has funded the government at 


