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stand about a movement where the argu-
ments on doctrinal questions "would tax 
the dialectical agility of a third-third-de-
gree Trotskyite." Whalen, however, ap-
preciates the diverse strains of American 
conservatism and the sturdy Character of 
the American conservative. 

But this essay and most of the others 
fail, almost totally, to explore the options 
available to those whose course of action 
Whalen is criticizing. , 	• 
• In the chapter on conservatism, for ex-
ample, we learn that-Joseph McCarthy 
was "a supreme opportunist," that Birch-
ers are simple-minded folk who some-
times graduate to normal partisan poli-
tics and that Goldwater and his friends 
failed to exploit their early political le-
verage with the Nixon Administration. 
After 35 pages of useful history and crit-
ical judgments, Whalen then devotes four 
paragraphs to flailing "knee-jerk con-
servatism" for "stale 'free enterprise'. 
rhetoric" and for failing to come to grips 
with the reality of the corporate state. 
What, one wonders, would Whalen have 
the conservatives do—other than bone up 
on economics? Where are his remedies, 
his programs? What, indeed, is his frame • 

-of reference other - than a vague 
Republicanism? Most of the time we do 
not know even what airport his flights of 
criticism take off from let alone where 
Whalen wants them to land. It is a curious 

failing in a book called Taking Sides. 
Whalen's most abiding interest seems 

,-to be in the men he has, written most 
about—Nixon and the several Kennedys. 
If he is not prescriptive, Whalen has at 
least caught the dynamic of the original 
Kennedy appeal, and he understands the 
importance of a legacy that is more than a 
'mythological Camelot. 

"What matters crucially is the core of 
the Kennedy legacy," Whalen writes. 
"That core is patriotism. From the first to 
the last of his thousand days in the presi-
dency, Kennedy told his fellow citizens 
that America was a good country which 
could become better. He expressed. the 
faith they felt in themselves, their values 
and their ideals. He called for individual 
and national sacrifice on behalf of those 
ideals, and this struck a deep chord.. ..." 

It is Whalen's belief that this legacy has 
been abandoned not by the American 
people but by its leaders and that they 
Will once again respond to a call to their 
better natures. "Our sickness of the spirit 
arises from a prolonged absence of just 
pride in what we have attempted and 
what we have accomplished," he writes. 
"Our cure will come with the restoration 
of honest, truthful and effective leader-
ship that demands the best in us—as we 
remember John Kennedy once did. His 
legacy awaits the leader who can claim 
it." 


