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Post Names Editorial Page Editor 
Philip L. Geyelin, Pulitzer Prize-

winning 'editor The Washington Post 
editorial page, will take a- sabbatical 
year to research and write a book on 
President Carter's conduct of Loreign 
policy. 

Meg Greenfield, deputy editor of 
the page and Newsweek colbmnist, 
will become editor of the editorial 
page, Post publisher Donald E. Gra-
ham announced. 

Geyelin won the Pulitzer Prize for 
editorial writing in 1970. The prize 
was awarded him for general excel- 

lence bf his editorials during the pre-
vious year. He 1968. Before joining 
The Post, Geyelin was with the Wall 
Street Journal for 20 years as a diplo- 
matic correspondent in the U.S. and 
abroad, He will return to The Post in 
a different capacity at the end of his 
sabbatical, Graham, said. 

Greenfield won the Pulitzer Prize 
for editorial writing in 1978. She came 
to the Post in 1969 from The Reporter 
magazine, where she had been a staff 
writer and Washington bureau chief. 


