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The United States agreed 
yesterday to meet North 
Korea at Panmunjom for 
the first direct confronta-
tion over the shooting down 
of a U.S. Navy reconnais-
sance plane over the Sea of 
Japan on Tuesday. 

The 290th meeting of the 
Korean Military Armistice 
Commission—at 11 a.m. Fri-
day, Korean time—was not 
viewed as an ideal forum for 
presentation of the American 
case. It was exported that Pres-
ident Nixon, in his televised 
news conference at 11:30 this 
morning, would make a strong 
statement aimed at persuad-
ing world opinion that the 
EC-121 was shot . down by 
North Korean Migs without 
provocation. 

The State Department 
planned to distribute the 
American Panmunjon state-
ment in Washington as soon 
as it was read there by Air 
Force Maj. Gen. James B. 
Knapp, senior member of the 
U.S. Armistice team. 

At the White House yester-
day morning, presidential 
press secretary Ronald L. Zieg-
ler, after two days of noncom-
mittal replies to reporters' in-
quiries about the incident, de-
clared: 

"It's becoming very clear 
that this unarmed plane on a 
routine reconnaissance mis-
sion was attacked ni intern-
tonal airspace. There could 
have been no mistake on the 
part of North Korea as to the 
location of the aircraft. It had  

not been in, nor had it in-
truded upon, the airspace of 
North Korea. 

Early yesterday, the Penta-
gon reported recovery of two 
bodies from the 31-man crew 
of the EC-121. 

"We are now gravely con-
cerned about the chances of 
finding any survivors," the De-
fense Department said. It 
withheld names of the two 
confirmed dead—one officer 
and one enlisted man—until 
next of kin were notified. 

The bodies were found by 
the destroyer Tucker "about 
17 miles north of the site 
where the debris was origi-
nally discovered," the Penta-
gon statement said. That site 
originally was described as 90 
to 100 nautical miles southeast 
of the North Korean port of 
Chongj in. 

In a second statement, is-
sued last night, the Pentagon 
said: "A five-square-mile area 
containing aircraft debris is 
being covered by the search 
vessels and aircraft at a point 
approximately 60 miles from 
the North Korean coast. No 
survivors have been seen." 
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In a speech before the 
American Society of News-
paper Editors yesterday, De-
fense Secretary Melvin R. 
Laird said the EC-I21 mission 
"was essential to our national 
security." 

He said there was "abso-
lutely nothing unusual about 
this mission"—an electronic 
intelligence flight out of the 
U.S. Navy base at Atsugi, 
Japan. 

Such missions, he said, con-
stitute "a lawful use of inter-
national airspace." But he de-
clined to go into any further 
detail "until the President 
makes his statement." 

In his first news conference 
after taking office as Defense 
Secretary, Laird had announc-
ed that his deputy, David 
Packard, would review last 
year's North Korean seizure 
of the U. S. spy ship Pueblo 
"to see that incidents like this 
cannot happen again." 

Asked yesterday what had 
happened to that review, 
Daniel Z. .Henkin, Pentagon 
press chief, said it was still in 
the works and had not yet 
been submitted to Laird. 

On Capitol Hill, members of  

the Senate Foreign Relations 
Committee spent two hours 
questioning Under Secretary 
of State Elliot L. Richardson 
in closed session without 
reaching any consensus. on 
whether flights such as the 
EC-121's shold be continued. 

"Nothing was said that 
would indicate to me that the 
information obtained would in 
any way justify taking this 
kind of risk," Committee 
Chairman J. W. Fulbright (D-
Ark,) told reporters after the 
session. 

But Sen. Karl E. Mundt (R-
S.D.) said he thought "most of 
the Committee agree with the 
position of the Government" 
on the need for such flights. 
Mundt referred to a new re-
connaissance plane "coming 
off the production line this 
year which will move fast 
enough to protect them-
selves." 

The Committee members 
who heard Richardson agreed 
that the plane clearly was well 
outside the 12-mile offshore, 
limit claimed by the North Ko-
reans, but that the incident 

Mundt and Fulbright said 
Richardson told them the 

President had not yet made up 
his mind on what the U.S. 
would do. Other sources said 
that a possible protest to the 
United Nations Security Coun-
cil was still under considera-
tion late yesterday. 

Mr. Nixon met yesterday 
with his national security ad-
viser, Dr. Henry A. Kissinger. 

The U.S. decision to attend 
the Panmunjom meeting was 
a difficult one, officials ac-
knowledged. It was assumed 
in Washington that the North 
Koreans had issued the invita-
tion in order to insult the 
United States with a propa-
ganda tirade. But it was de-
cided, after almost 48 hours of 
discussion, that keeping open 
channels of communication 

with North Korea justified the 
risk of polemics at Panmun-
j on. 

Last Friday's meeting of the 
armistice commission ran 11 
hours and 35 minutes, with 
Gen. Knapp and North Ko-
rea's Maj. Gen. Ri Choon Sun 
glaring at each other word-
lessly for the final 41/2 hours 
as Knapp waited for Ri to pro-
pose a recess. 

Early yesterday, Pyongang's 



Korean Central News Agency, 
in a broadcast monitored in 
Tokyo, quoted North Korean 
Defense Minister Gen. Choi 
Hyun as warning that "a war 
may break out again at any 
moment, owing to the aggres-
sive maneuvers of the U.S. im-
perialists." 


