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Pooh-PoopsIdea of 
Dallas Conspiracy 

In a long, detailed analysis of the as-
. sassination of President John F. Kennedy, 
one of Britain's most prominent scholars 
pooh-poohs the idea of a conspiracy. 

The scholar is John Sparrow, an all-
cial of Alt Souls College, Oxford. In an 
article in the Times Literary Supple-

f ment, Mr. Sparrow closely examined the 
arguments put forth by critics of the 
Warren Report on the assassination. Mr. 
Sparrow said that he did not agree wholly 
with the report in all its findings, but did 
agree with its determination' ti at Lee 
Harvey Oswald acted alone in the assas-
sination of the President Nov. 22, 1963, 
in Dallas. Critics of the report, he said, 
have acted foolishly and recklessly. 

Some of those critical of the Warren 
Report say that other assassins shot the 
President from a grassy knoll while Os-
wald was firing from a building. "It it is 
hard to believe that Oswald hit his 

(

target in two out of three quick shots." 
says Mr. Sparrow, "it is harder still to 
suppose that two men, more than 100 
yards apart and unable to see or com-
municate with each other, could have 
synchronized their fire so perfectly. And 
it is hardest of all to Imagine that con-
spirators would have allowed the success 
of their plan to depend on such a feat of 
ynchroniza tion." 

Mr. Sparrow says it is "really im-
possible" to believe that conspirators 
would have placed a gunman in the 
grassy knoll "in total ignorance of how 
many lookers-on, when the procession 
passed, would be standing nearby or per-
haps actually occupying the place selected 
as his firing point." The British scholar 
says he does not believe the Warren Re-
port critics have taken part in any "con-
certed plan of action" nor does he mean 
to "impute sinister motives" to them. 
"To do so," Mr. Sparrow says, "would be 
to fall into their own besetting error." 


