
2 Witnesses 
Testify Shaw 
Knew Ferrie 

By John P. MacKenzie 
Washington Pon Starr Writer 

EW ORLEANS, Feb. 27—
Clay L. Shaw took the witness 
stand in this own defense to-
day and denied he conspired 
to assassinate President John 
F. Kennedy or that he even 
knew his alleged co-conspira-
tors David Ferrie and Lee 
Harvey Oswald. 

But three hours later, two 
surprise rebuttal witnesses 
rocked the courtroom with 
testimony that they saw Shaw 
and Ferrie together in 1984. 
The new witnesses, 
Tadin and his wife 
v1517freered their stories only 
this morning. 

Tadin said he had not want- ' 
ed "to get involved" but 
changed his mind while watch-
ing TV reports because he 
knew Shaw and Ferrie were 
acquainted. 

The testimony of Tadin and 
his wife was the State's re- , 
sponse to the testimony of 
Shaw, who had categorically 
denied every element of the 
murder conspiracy charge 
against him including ever 
having known Ferrie. 

It appeared that it would 
soon be known what effect the 
testimony had on the jury as 
Judge Edward A. Haggerty Jr. 
announced that some time on 
Friday he would submit to the 
all-male panel the ease that 
began 38 days ago. 

See SHAW, A5, Col. 
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