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Court Orders New Secrecy 
Of Scientology Documents 

. By Timothy S. Robinson 
Washinaton Peat Staff Writer 

,,The .U.S. Court of Appeals ruled 
here yesterday that a lower court 
judge improperly made public some 
231000 documents last fall that the fed-
eral government had seized from the 
Church of Scientology in a criminal 
investigation. 

=Although the documents have been 
avrailable to the public in court files 
fa_ the last nine months and widely 
read and publicized, the 2-to-I appel-
late court ruling yesterday again 
makes them secret. The court ac• 
kaowledged . the apparent irony of 
that situation, but said it felt the re-
newed. secrecy was needed so as not 
to-"compound the errors we perceive 
in the [lower] court's original orders." 

The 70-page opinion, written by U.S. 
Circuit Judge Patricia Wald, is the lat-
est of several court actions in what 
the appellate court itself referred to 
aa' the "tortuous proceedings" sur-
roUnding the government's criminal 
prosecution of the Church of Scientol-
ogy on charges of wiretapping, bur-
glary and infiltration of government 
offices. 
,,Nine high-ranking officials of the 

church; inclduing' the wife of its 
fciiinder, were convicted .last fall by 
U.S. District Judge Charles R. Richey. 
Two.  others are awaiting trial before 
another judge, and the 'government 
and the church have been locked in 
bitter clashes concerning the legality 

• of the church searches and other as-
pects of the case. 

.Yesterday's opinion focuses only on 
Richey's decision last October to re-
lease to the public various documents 
that had been presented to him in a 
hearing on the legality of a search 
warrant of the church's headquarters 
in Los Angeles on July 8, 1977. 

Richey said the documents, which 
included information about alleged 
plots by the church against politi-
cians, authors and others critical of 
the church, should be made available 
to the public because "there is a right 
in the public to know what occurs be-
fore the court" and "sunshine is the 
best disinfectant." 

The defendants in the criminal case 
objected, and the Church of Scientol-
ogy (which was not a defendant) also 
tried to intervene in the case to ob-
ject: Richey ruled against both 

groups, and reporters and others—in-
cluding several Scientologists—read 
through the doctiments for several 
days in a special room in the court-
house. 

Both groups argued before Richey 
and on appeal that the only reason,  
the documents had been presented at 
the hearing on the search as in an 
attempt to show that the search was 
unlawful. They never agreed that any 
documents would be made public ex-. 
cept 400 upon which the government 
specifically relied to' get, convictions, 
they added.  

The appellate court rifled.  Yesterday; 
however, that the church had a right 
to intervene in the criminal proceed-
ings before Richey because, ..among 
other reasons, the material; had been 
taken from its property. 	' 

Wald. writing for herself and U.S. 
Circuit Judge Spottswood Robinson 
III, said they agreed with Richey that 
the public generally has access to rec-
ords of a judicial proceeding. How- 
ever, they added that there are excep- 
tions to that general right of access 
and said Richey did not give enough 
explanation of why he felt these par-
ticular documents should be made 
public. 

"...We think the unsealing decision 
Ilay Richey] was an abuse of discre- 
tion," Wald said. "Under all of these 
circumstances we conclude that the 
purposes of public access are only 
modestly served by the trial judge's 
unsealing decision." 

They said it was clear that the only 
purpose for the documents' being 
shown to the judge was for his use in 
determining the legality of the search 
and that the judge -Was well aware 
that his ruling upholding the search 
would be appealed. 

"The possibility of reversal on ap-
peal contributes to the irony inherent 
in the decision to unseal the docu-
ments at issue," Wald added. 

U.S. Circuit Judge George Mac-
Kinnon strongly dissented, saying the 
public would not have had any way of 
determining the basis for Richey's rul-
ing in the case if he had not made the 
records public. 

. .The Church of Scientology 
wants secrecy, not privacy," Mac-
Kinnon said. "Judicial proceedings are 
not secret in our society." 


