
Deaths Elsewhere 

Landlady 
Of Oswald 
AliTakilSV 

line Roberts, landlady of Lee 
Harvey Oswald, assassin of 
President Kennedy, died to-
day, little more than two 
years after her small rooming 
house became a landmark. 
She was 60. 

Mrs. Roberts is the second 
,person connected with the as- 
sassination to die in recent 
weeks. The taximan, William 
W. Whaley, who drove Oswald 
from downtown Dallas to a 
spot in Oak Cliff near his 
rooming house just after the 
slaying was killed in a traffic 
accident Dec. 18. 

Oswald rented a small room 
from Mrs. Roberts at 1026 
Beckley ave. under an as-
sumed name a few weeks be-
fore the tragedy on Nov. 22, 
1063. It was there Oswald 
went to change jackets and 
pick up a revolver with which 
he killed policeman J. D. 
Tipptt. 

Mrs. Roberts's small house 
was flooded by sighs seers, tou- 
rists and 	curious. Photo- 
graphers pal handsome fees 
to take pictinirs. the 
ouse a year iigoanval—TaTrun-

se. 
S e led 

attack At Parkland Hospital, 
where President Kennedy was 
pronounced dead and where 
Oswald died. 


