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NovelIdea Rot"i 
COLUMBUS, Ohio — The 

attorney for Gordon Novel 
said his client would be 
willing to testify before a 
joint session, of the Louisi-v 
ana state legislature about 
an inquiry into the Kennedy ,  

assassination if he is grain-
ed immunity for arrest 
while in the South. Novel 
is wanted as a witness by 
District Attorney Jim Barri-
son of New Orleans in con-
nection . with the latter's 
probe of President. Ken-
nedy's death and the Louisi-
ana legislature has already 
Passed a resolutioli asking 
his extradition from Ohio. 
Gov. MeKeithen has already 
said the 'Louisiana • legisla- 
ture has more important 
things to do than listen to 
Navel. 


