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At a time in 1972 when he 
later claimed to be preoccu-
pied by "crucially impor-
tant" foreign and domestic 
problems. Watergate tape 
transcripts show President 
Nixon to be deeply absorbed 
in the nuts 'and bolts of his 
re-election campaign. 

He worried about helicop-
ter prop wash spoiling the 
coiffures of his wife and 
daughters a t the Miami 
GOP 	convention. 	H e. 
weighed the political advan-
tages of posing for photos 
with Southern Democratic 

• congiessional candidates .  
And he cautioned his ad-

visers- against trying t o 
atage, "non-political" cultu-
ral events because et, the 
supposed influence of Jewish 
left-wingers in the arts. 

i
The. painstaking personal 

concern , 	with political minu- 
tiae reflected by site edited 
conversations released Mon-
day contrasts with the pot-
trait of an above - the - bat-
tle President that Mr. Nixon 
sought to present to the 
country. 

In l$s first full-scale tele-
vision address on Water-
,ate. on April 30, 1973, Mr. 
Nixon said that in the past 
he had always personally di-
rected h i s election 'cam-
paign, 

' Bw the 11472 campaign 
was different, Mr., Nixon 
contended. because of Im-
pending major decisions of 
state confronting him at ._ 
home 	a n d. 	especially, 
abroad, where he was striv-
ing to bring "peace to Amer-
ica and peace to the world." 

"That is why I decided." 
he said. "that the presiden-
cy should come first and pol-
itics second . . . I sought to 
delegate campaign opera-
tions, and to remove the 
day-to-day campaign deci-
sions from the President's 
off ice.'' 

But on June 23. 1072. talk- 

ing with his former chief of 
staff, H. R. Haldeman, Mr. 
Nixon found time to discuss 
t h e grooming problems 
faced by the First Lady and 
his daughters during the Mi-
'arni teach convention which 
would 'take place t w o 
months later. 

"pat raised the point last 
night that probably she and 
the girls ought to stay in a 

hotel on Miami Beach," he 
said. "First she says the 
moment they get the heli-. 
copter and get off and so 

.•forth, it ,destroys their hair , 
and so forth.  
"And of course. that is ) 

true 	even though you turn 
them off and turn them on." 

Mrs. Nixon and her daugh- 
ters wound up staying at • 
Key Biscayne with the T're, ' 

'dent- and traveling by hell-.  
copter to the convention. 

In his conversation with 
Haldeman. • M r. 	Nixon 
brought up the question of 
which congressional candi-
dates he should be photo- 
graphed with. 

• 
"The problem that.' have 

with it is that I_ do not want 
to have pictures with catida 
dates that are running with 

Democrats — or against 
Democrats that may either 
be (unintetlligiblei or might 
be for us . . . 

. The way to have 
the pictures with the candi-
date — this • would be a very 
clever thing, is to call both 
Democrats — t h e good 

.. Southern Democrats a n d 
those flew like (tintntelligi-
hle t who did have a picture 

alvith me, see, and then call 
„ them up and say look 

. If you would 
like to come down• to the of-
fice. you know, you cart have 
a picture taken that you are 
welcome to use. 

". . . I think that getting 
to the candidates out there 

Athat are very busy and so 
forth may help us a bit ....- 

. . I think when I ran 
in '46." Mr. Nixon recalled 
"I would have gotten on my 
hands and knees for a pic-
ture ivith Harold Stasaer.  

!then a leading Hera:lean 
politician t . 

The President had firm 
views about what Haldeman 
referred M. as "nonpolitical" 
campaign events. 

"N o w the u orse (sic 
thing i unitelligiblej," Mr. 
Nixon said. "is to go to any-
thing that was to do with the 
arts . . . the arts you know 
— they're J e w s, they're 
left-wing — in other words. 
stay away..' 

During ME Nixon's years 
as f' r e s i de n t. the White 
House adviser most directly 
concerned with the arts has 
been Leonard Garment, a 
former law partner of Mr. 
Nixon, who is Jewish. 

Though in his April 30 
.spee:11-  Mr. Nixon said he 
had "severely filthier his 
personal appearances in the 

'campaign, during his con-
versation withal aldeman, he 
planned an active role for 
himself. 

--I think of the campaign 
a• he -  told Ilaldeman. "1 
nk sometimes when a, e're 

here in Washington, you 
know, supposedly doing the 
business..of the government, 
that I can call people around 
the country — people4that 
will come out for "us — and 

• ;'ti forth — like (unintelligi-
ble' for example, Demo:  
crass come out for us." 

put when the discussion 
Wined to international eco-
nomics. the President gave 
short' shrift to the troubled 
world currency market. 

"Did you get the report 
Mat the British floated the 
pound?" Haldeman asked. 

"No, I don't. think so," Mr. 
Nixon replied. 

"Flanigan's ' i White House 
aide Peter Flanigan) got a 
report on it here," Halde-
man offered. 

"1 don't care about it," 
Mr. Nixon said. "nothing we 
can do about it." 

Haldeman then mentioned 
that Arthur M. Burns. Fed-
eral Reserve Board chair-
man. expected a five per 
cent devaluation of the  

pound against the dotiar. 
"Yeah," said Mr. Nixon. 

"O.K. Fine." 
Haldeman added: "Burns 

is concerned about specula-
tion about the lira." 

"Well I don't give a iex-
pletive deleted) about the 
lira," Mr. Nixon said. Halde-
man changed the subject. 


