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President Nixon will 
neither talk to federal 
prosecutors nor answer 
their questions about the 
Watergate case because it 
would be "constitution-
ally inappropriate,." Presi-
dential press secretary 
Ronald L. Ziegler said 
yesterday. 

Ziegler responded to ques-
tions following a report in 
yesterday's Washington Post 

-that the prosecutors have 
told the Justice Department 
that there is justification for 
calling Mr. Nixon before the 
federal grand jury investi-
gating the Watergate scan-
dal. 

In a related development, 
special Watergate prosecu-
tor Archibald Cox issued a 
statement yesterday after 
Ziegler said that Cox would 
be asked and Attorney Gen-
eral Elliot L. Richardson 
had been asked to 
"investigate the circum-
stance of these anonymous 
charges against the Presi-
dent of the United States." 

Cox did not mention Zie-
gler's statement but said, 
"All decisions about theo-
ries of investigation or pros-
ecution, the grant of inunti- 

nity, the acceptance of pleas 
in return for testimony, and 
the conduct of the investiga-
tion will be made by me. I 

, have made no such deci-
sions, and authorized none. I 
have not had time to review • 
the results of the on-going 
investigation and have nei-
ther endorsed nor disap-
proved any charges .or. the-
ory of the case." 

Cox read his statement, 
which was distributed by 
the Justice Department; to 
reporters after, meeting at 
the department with United 
States Attorney Harold H. 
Titus Jr., principal Assistant 
United States Attorney Earl 
J. Silbert and Assistant 
United States Attorneys 
Seymour Glanzer and •Don-
ald Campbell. 

Although the statement 
referred to no one by name, 
it 	contained 	unusually , 
strong language concerning 
Titus and the . prosecution 
team. "The U.S. attorney 
and his 'aides," /Cox said, 
•"have been instructed to re- 
frain from any kind of state- 
ment, comment or specula-
tion about any aspect of the 
investigation, All officials in 
the Department of Justice 
will be. so instructed. No 
previous statement or com-
ment about any aspect of 
the investigation has been 
authorized by me." 

Cox also announced that 
James F. Neal, a Nashville 
lawyer and former aide to 
Attorney General Robert F. 
Kennedy, ' was joining the 
special prosecutor's staff as 
a special assistant "for two 
weeks or longer if he can." 
Philip E. Heymann and 
James Vorenberg, who, like 
Cox, are Harvard law pro- 
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fessors, were sworn yester-
day as special assistants. 

During the regular White 
House press briefing yester-
day, Ziegler was asked 
whether the President 
would be willing to talk to 
the prosecution in the 
Watergate 	investigation. 
"No," Ziegler replied. Asked 
why not, Ziegler said, "It 
would be constitutionally in-
appropriate. It would do vio-
lence to the separation. of 
powers." 

Ziegler said that J. Fred 
l3uzhardt, who is serving as 
a special counsel to Mr. 
Nixon for the Watergate 
scandal, had contacted Rieh-
ardson Monday night about 
The Washington Post report 
that prosecutors believe 
there is justification for 
calling Mr. Nixon before the 
grand jury. 

The story attributed to Jus-
tice Department sources 
the statement that the Presi-
dent's role in the Watergate 
case is the one key question 
that remains to be clarified 
in the grand jury investiga-
tion. 

The Post reported that ac-
cording to these sources, the 
prosecutors have told their 
superiors that evidence jus-
tified questioning the Presi-
dent about how mexpbers 
of Mr. Nixon's _innermost 
circle could perpetrate a 
massive obstruction of jus-
tice without his knowledge. 

Ziegler told The Post ' 
Monday that the story 
"reflects a shocking and -ir-
responsible abuse of author-
ity on the part of federal 
prosecutors, if in fact, they 
made the statements attrib-
uted to them." Asked yester-
day what was irresponsible, 
Ziegler said it was that al-
leged proceedings of the 
grand jury "found their way 
into newspapers again." 

Ziegler said., Blythe:  Mt 
called Cox yesterday and 

. "expressed our severe con-
cern and expressed our view 
when he said the Justice De-
partment 

 
 should find out 

how it happened and make 
sure it won't happen again." 

Cox's only reference to 
the matter in his statement 
came at the conclusion: "I 
prepared this statement 
prior to Mr. Buzhardt's tele-
phone call. I gave him the 
substance of it then and 
later read it to him, solely 
to confirm the accuracy of 



what I had said." Cox de-, 
dined to answer any ques-
tions following the reading 
of his statement. 

Asked if Mr. Nixon would 
respond to writteh questions 
from the prosecutor, Ziegler 
said, "No." 

At least one historical 
precedent exists for calling 
a President to testify while 
he is holding office. During 
the treason trial of Aaron 
Burr in 1807, President 
Thomas Jefferson was sub-
poenaed by the defense to 
give testimony. 

According to an opinion by 
Chief Justice John Marshall,  

sitting on.circuit at the time, 
President Jefferson declined 
to appear in Richmond to give 
testimony but ,agreed to give 
a deposition In Washington. 

Marshall's opinion in Uni- • 
ted States v. Burr was cited 
last June by Justice Byron 
White in the course of the 

jilpylty opinion in Branz-
`-bii -viz Hayes, which in-
volved the right of a grand 
jury to compell -testimony-' 
from a newsman. In a foot-
note to the opinion, White 
noted, "Chief Justice Mar-
shall, sitting on circuit, 
opined that • in proper .-ir 
cumstances a subpoena 
could be issued to the Presi-
dent of the United States." 

Meanwhile, 'U.S. District 
Chief Judge John J. Sirica 
yesterday approved a grant 
of immunity for Roy. H. 
Shepard to testify before  

the Senate committee hold-
ing bearings on Watergate. 

Attorneys for Sheppard 
. have said in court papers 

that he was asked to go to 
the Executive Office Build- 

g 'two days after the 
atergatt burglary td get 

eight cartons of material 
that had been taken from a 
safe belonging to convicted 
Watergate conspirator E. 

-`11dward Hiint Jr. 
Sheppard is now employed 

by a trucking firm, his at-
torney said yesterday. He 
has been identified as a 
former campaign worker for 
the Committee for the Re-
election of the President. 


