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New Flap at New Republic 
• By Jean M. White 

Stanley Karnow, foreign 
editor of The New Republic 
for the last two years, re-
signed yesterday in a squab-
ble over the magazine's cov-
erage of the Mayaguez inci-
dent. 

If the Mayaguez seizure 
provided the flashpoint to 
ignite Karnow's resignation 
yesterday morning, the dis-
pute came after persistent 
reports of tensions among 
the magazine's staff since 
Martin Peretz purchased the 
liberal weekly over a year 
ago. 

Karnow becomes the sec-
ond of a six-man inner circle 
of top editors to resign in 
the last few months. Doris 
Grumbach, the literary edi-
tor, is leaving the end of 
June. 

Both Peretz and Karnow 
agree that the flap that 
erupted yesterday in Per- 
etz's 	third-floor 	office 

turned on whether The New 
Republic should run a 
signed article of lead edito-
rial on the Mayaguez affair 
in this week's edition 
(available today):  

But from there on, it gets 
more complicated, with the 
surfacing of underlying disa-
greements over editorial 
style, principle and policy. 

All that we have had on 
the important Mayaguez 
question has been a two-par-
agraph note `Karnow wrote 
it) rushed into print the day 
after the seizure," Karnow 
said yesterday. "I felt we 
should have a piece this 
week. I had some hard ques- 

tions to raise. I told Marty 
that I didn't think we could 

*ignore it." 
With no word on Wednes-

day and the magazine dead-
line yesterday, Karnow said 
he again raised the question 
yesterday morning and was 
told that he perhaps could 
write a piece next week. 

As for Peretz, he count-
ered that he considered it a 
"rather off principle" to re-
sign !because an article can't 
run in a certain .week's edi- 
tion. 	• 

"I resent a little bit any-
one trying to make this a 
matter ' of principle," The 
New Republic owner said.  

"Karnow and I haVe dif-
fered before, mostly over 
business matters . 	I know 
he's been looking for a job." 

Karnow, a veteran foreign 
correspondent who wrote on 
Asian affairs for The Wash-
ington Post for seven years. 
insisted that principle was 
involved and that a lot of 
problems came to a head at 
this time. 

"We're not just talking 
about a technical matter"' 
he emphasized. "My basic 
position is that we should 
have a piece of the Maya-
guez this week. This is not 
daily journalism but it is 
journalism." 

David Sanford the maga-
zine's managing editor, who 
feels The New Republic is 
"a better magazine than it 
used to be," stressed the 
magazine doesn't overlook 
important new events and 
will have a piece on Maya-
guez "if not next week, then 
soon after." 

,"Karnow becomes the second of a six-man 

inner-circle of top editors to resign in the 

last few months. Doris Grumbach, the liter-

ary editor, is leaving the end of June." 


